TUCSON UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS AND COST SHEETS PAGE 1 OF 18
FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||[ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:35::;5'3 QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cask packl case pricE LEAD TIME
CASES
CHEESE CHEDDAR SHREDDED
Real cheddar cheese made from cow's milk, .
pasteurized with salt. Enzymes and artificial color may Only, if
be used. Product is standard shred type, yellow in bidding
e iy 2e259% | an e
007165| 1000 | o P 9 : STIPP other than| 138 4/5#ics | unitsof5 | 1LB
refrigerated. Shelf life 90 day guaranteed to 150 day ound
from date of manufacture. Approved Brands: Approved an P
Brands: Land O Lakes # 41749, Chef's Choice, Kraft, approved
Schreiber # 54532 , Beatrice or Approved Equal. Brand
Estimated usage dependent on commodity allocation
from USDA.
Malone Meat & Poultry Schreiber 08243 $ 2.660 4/5lb $ 53.21 | 14-18 days
Mama Lola's No bid
Land o lakes MFG-41749
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods Shamrock #2416361 2.488 4/5 b $ 49.76
CHEESE CHEDDAR SLICED REDUCED FAT )
Real cheddar cheese made from cow's milk w/salt. Only, if
Enzymes and artificial color may be used. Product is bidding
sliced and yellow in color. Product has less fat content an item MUST
than regular cheddar. Mild Flavor. Each slice not to Must State STATE
008673 | 1001 exceed 1 oz. maximum, .50 oz. minimum. Must state other than 208 Pack Size | PACK SIZE 1LB
pack size of item bidding. an OF BRAND
Approved Brands: Land O Lakes 44214, Schreiber # approved
19539, or Approved Equal. Estimated usage Brand
dependent on commaodity allocation from USDA.
Malone Meat & Poultry no bid
Mama Lola's no bid
Land o Lakes MFG # 44224
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods Shamrock # 3167491 3.759 8/15/Ib |$ 4511 3-4 week
CHEESE MOZZARELLA Shredded LMPS Only, if
Part skim,100% low moisture. Standard feather shred bidding
zi:t with minimal breakage and consistent, easy to an item Case of 4
007173 | 1004 Approved Brands: Schreiber 54242 , Luzatti, Bongards other than 81 4/s#ics unlct)zr?LS L8
# 75507-1, Land O Lakes 41698 or Approved Equal. an P
Estimated usage dependent on commodity allocation approved
from USDA. Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry SChre'bengigz)( number | ¢ 2521 451 |§ 50.41 | 14-18 days

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS AND COST SHEETS PAGE 2 OF 18
FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION ;\:ALYSIS QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
QUIRED CASES
Mama Lola's no bid
Land o Lakes MFG #41698
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods Shamrock code #2987331 $ 2.477 4/5/lb $ 49.54
Only, if
g:iafeEdSEe;rl:n‘::xEcsh‘::s:H%Ksi:ker top container or bidding Case of
007175 1005 parm ' P . an item 156 12/1#/cs | twelve units | 1 LB
state pack size. Approved Brands: Kraft, Schreiber of 1 pound
25459, Arthur Schuman # 1032 or Approved Equal. other than p
an
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poultry Arthur Schuman 1032 $ 4.840 12/11b $ 58.08 | 14-21-days
Mama Lola's no bid
Messa MFG#1032 Shamrock
Shamrock Foods code #4217571 $ 5.107 12/1/lb $ 61.28| 10 days
CHEESE STICK, MILD CHEDDAR, REDUCED FAT t())(rj”g’ i
Cheese, mild cheddar, cut into 1 ounce square stick of ! ) ing
1 ounce and individually cryovac packaged. Case pack [ an item Case of 160
010099 | 1009 |is bulk. Shipped and stored under HACCP temperature |other than 75 10z/160/cs | 102
) units of 1 OZ
standards. Approved Brands: Schreiber, Land O an
Lakes 44881 or Approved Equ.al. Estlmated usage approved
dependent on USDA commodity allocation.
Brand
Malone Meat & Poult .
Y no bid
Mama Lola's no bid
Land O Lakes MFG
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods #44881 Shamrock Code 168/10z | $ 41.30
#3045631 $ 0.246
CHEESE STICK, COLBY JACK, REDUCED FAT Only, if
Cheese, Colby jack, reduced fat content and cut into 1 bidding
ounce square stick portion and individually cryovac an item
packaged. Case pack is bulk. Shipped and stored Case of 168
010098 | 1010 under HACCP temperature standards. Approved other than 108 1 0z/168/cs units of 1 OZ 10z
Brand: Schreiber, Land O Lakes 44878 or Approved an
Equal. Estimated usage dependent on USDA approved
commodity allocation. Brand
Malone Meat & Poult .
Y no bid
Mama Lola's .
no bid

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||[ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:35:}5;3 QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
CASES
Land o Lakes MFG #
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods 44878 Shamrock Code 168/10z | $ 4130 | 10days
#3045611 $ 0.246
Only, if
BUTTER PATS, FOIL WRAPPED SALTED bld.dmg CASE OF
Salted butter, portioned into square shaped sliced of an item Approx. 800 [APPROXIMA
010171] 1013 |approximately 1/3 ounce and wrapped in foil. other than 3 units per TELY 1LB
Approved Brand: Shamrock Dairy 6019 or approved an case SEVENTEE
equal. approved N POUNDS
Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry no bid
NO AWARD Mama Lola's no bid
Shamrock Foods .
no bid
Only, if
bidding CASE
BUTTER SALTED an item THIRTY
Butter, Solid, Quartered, Salted, packed 30 ct/ 1 Ib per 30CT/1LB| UNITS OF
011260 1014 case. Approved Brands: Shamrock Dairy # 3009 or other than 3 | CASE ONE 1.8
approved equal. an POUND
approved EACH
Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry no bid
Mama Lola's .
no bid
Shamrock Farms MFG
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods #51431 Shamrock Code #
1930471 $ 2.941 130/1 Ib $ 88.23
Only, if
CREAMERS, PORTION CONTROL bidding
Individual portion control units of half -and half cream an item Case of 400
008732 | 1016 |for beverages. 15 gram of cream per unit. 400 ct/case |other than 21 400/CS units of 15 [ 1 unit
or state pack size. Approved Brand: Shamrock Dairy # an gram
1514, Alta Dena or approved equal. approved
Brand
Shamrock Farms 219807
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poult
Y (400 count) $ 0.261 |400 ct $  10.44 |7-14 days
Mama Lola's .
no bid

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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NUTRIENT ([ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
numser[[HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:3535'3 QUANTITY=|" "0 " BiD UNIT || uniT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE ||\« oa el cask price [|LEAR TIME
CASES
Shamrock Farms MFG#51431
Shamrock Foods Shamrock Code # 0060801 $ 0.028 | 400/.380z | $ 11.26
Yogurt Plain Low Fat QUART
Dairy Product, Creamy Texture with Slight Tart Taste. Only, if
Plain Flavor. Made from Low-Fat Milk, 32 oz Container biddin
or MUST State Pack Size. MUST STATE LEAD TIME daing 6 CT /32 CASE OF
IF EXTENDED OVER 14 DAYS. APPROVED an item SIX 32
009514 1021 [BRANDS: Land O Lakes # 6356300, Stonyfield Farms, |other than 20 oz/ OUNCE 10z
Upstate Farms, YONSOON, Dannon # 366320020, an CASE [CONTAINER
Yoplait, Shamrock Dairy or Approved Equal. approved S
Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry no bid
Mama Lola's no bid
Land o Lakes MFG #6356300
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods Shamrock Gode #1925441 $ 0.082 | 6/320z |$ 15.69
Yogurt, Fruit , Extended Shelf Life Sgldy i
Assorted Flavors of yogurt, flavor blended into the ! ) Ing
product, creamy texture, ninety day refrigerated shelf an item Case of 48/4
010282 | 1023 |life, packed 48 ct/4 oz/case or state pack size. Please |other than 8541 48/4 oz/cs Tl 1 UNIT
X ounce unit
state flavors available. Approved Brands: Upstate an
ZZS;S 112893, 112954, 112923, 112916 or approved approved
’ Brand
Upstate Farms.
Strawberry
#9815/Strawberry banana
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poultry #9820/ peach #9818/
raspberry 9817/ code
number change (same
product) $ 0.253 |48/40z. |$ 12.12 |14 days
Mama Lola's .
no bid
Upstate Strawberry/ban
sh K Food MFG#9820 Shamrock
amrock Foods Code #2391961 Upstate
Strawberry MFG#9815
Shamrock Code #2406851 | $ 0.269 |48/4 oz $ 12.92

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||[ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:35:;;3 QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
CASES
BACON ROUND, PRE-COOKED, 192 slices t())g:jy‘ i
Pre-cooked round shape bacon, 4" diameter processed ! ) Ing
from No. 1 pork bellies, Cured and smoked, lean and an item CASE OF
007018 | 1327 |well streaked. Packed 192 sliced per case. Product |other than 1694 192 sl/cs 1 SLICE
. R 192 SLICES
stored and shipped frozen. State weight per case. an
ﬁgg:g::g E(r]a:]r;(lis: Armour # 44109, Hormel 25779 or approved
’ Brand
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poultry
Armour #44109 $ 0.168 [3/1.32Ibs $ 32.16 |14 days
Mama Lola's no bid
Shamrock Foods Hormel MFG#25779 shamrock 1/4.41b 192
code #190411 $ 0.189 |slices $ 36.19
Only, if
PEPPERONI, SLICED Case of 2 ct b'ddy"
5 Ib bags, sliced pepperoni. .071-.1 oz/Slice. Diameter ! ) Ing MUST
no greater than 1.5 inch. Beef or Pork Skinless, No by | an item scT/siB/|  sTATE
007537 | 1329 |Products, Fillers, Cereals, Extenders, or artificial colors. |other than 10 1LB
. CASE PACK SIZE
Product shipped HACCP temperature. Approved an
. OF BRAND
Brands: Hormel # 45128 , Margherita # 22014 or d
Approved Equal. approve
Brand
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poult
ry Margherita #22014 $ 2.758 |2/5 b $ 27.58 |14 days
Mama Lola's )
no bid
Hormel MFG#32048 Shamrock
Shamrock Foods
Code #0614241 $ 3.119 |2/51b $ 31.19
Only, if
TURKEY BREAST WHITE MEAT, SLICED bidding
SO ety rspectd e s x| an e
009844 | 1330 v, WY coorec ; ! otherthan| 25 6/2 #/CASE | unitsof2 | 1LB
.67 - .70 ounce "D" shaped portion. Pack size: 6/2 Ib. ounds each
Approved Brands: JENNIE 0 8483, Perdue 75121 or an p
approved equal. approved
Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry
Perdue #75121 $ 4.440 [6/2 Ib $ 53.28 |14 days
Mama Lola's .
no bid
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods JeniO MFG#8483
Shamrock Code #0442141 | $ 3.983 |6/2Ib $  47.79 |10 days

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||[ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:35::!2 QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
CASES
TORTILLA, WHITE WHEAT 6" WHOLE GRAIN Only, if
Tortilla, six inch diameter, 28 grams per tortilla, made bidding CASE OF 12
of whole grain-rich flour. One tortilla provides 1. oz an item PACKAGES
equivalent towards grain requirement of the NSLP. 12 CT/ 24
012780 1336 |\im is packed 12 CT/24 CT CASE. Approved otherthan 116 cricase |°F ZP“E';ACH 1 EACH
Brands: La Canasta 1506309 or or approved equal. an PACKAGE
Estimated usage dependent on USDA commodity approved :
allocation. Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry no bid
Mama Lola's 300c $ 1.800| 24/01DZ |$ 43.20
La Canasta MFG#1506309
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods Shamrock Code #3425791 $ 0.093 12/24pk $ 26.65
CREAM CHEESE AND YOGURT SPREAD, PORTION
CONTROL Only, if
Cream cheese blended with non fat yogurt, off white in bidding
color, soft and spreadable at refrigerated temperature. an item Case of 100
Packed 100 ct/ 1 oz portion control plastic containers 1 0z/100
007170] 1394 | ° : . . other than 5919 ct1oz 10z
with paper preprinted lid. Gluten Free. ltem provides 4 ct/cs ortions
grm protein per serving. Stored and shipped at an P
HACCP refrigerated temperature. approved
Approved Brands: Franklin's Foods - Hahn's # Brand
FG82172 or Approved Equal
Malone Meat & Poultry no bid
Mama Lola's no bid
Hahn's MFG#FG82172 Shamrock
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods Code #3634851 0.147 | 100/10z | $ 14.72 10days

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||[ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:35:;5;3 QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
CASES
Yogurt Vanilla Non-Fat Extended Shelf
Life 51b Only, if
Dairy Product, Creamy Texture, Vanilla taste profile. bidding
Made from Grade A Non - Fat Milk, Packed 4 ct Five Ib an item CASE OF
tub per case. Product has 75 day shelf life. Item has 4 ct/5Ib| FOURFIVE
013159 1410 (gratis pump apparatus to fit tub. APPROVED other than| 1640 case POUND 10z
BRANDS: Upstate Farms ~ # 078800 - 113237 or an TUBS
Approved Equal. approved
Brand
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poultry Upstate Farms: 9886 $ 0.059 4/5 Ibs $ 18.95 14 days
Mama Lola's no bid
Shamrock Foods Upstate MFG #9822 $ 0.300 48/4/0z $ 14.42 | 3-4 week
STRING CHEESE, 1 oz REGULAR FAT CONTENT
Low moisture, part skim mozzarella cheese in 1 oz )
individual package. Calories from fat not to exceed 7 Only, if
gram per 1 oz serving. One ounce serving provides 1 bidding
M/MA towards NSLP menu requirements. Pack size an item
160 ct or 360 ct. State pack size which must remain 10z/360 ct | Case of 360
010975 1499 constant for the life of the bid. Must state if product is other than 447 /cs units of 1 OZ 10z
shipped frozen or refrigerated. Clearly state expiration an
coding. Approved Brands: National Food Group approved
GOVST1A, Land O Lakes 59701, Bongards # 40295-1 Brand
or Approved Equal. Estimated usage dependent on
USDA commodity allocation.
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poultry Land o Lakes 59701 $ 0.174 | 168 count &/ ¢ 33.99
(refridgerated) 1.5 Ibs
Mama Lola's no bid
Land O Lakes MFG#59701
Shamrock Foods Shamrock Foods #2711831 $ 0.201 | 168/10z | $ 33.74
Only, if
TORTILLA WHITE FLOUR, 12", HAND STRETCHED | bjidding
Clamete, Pack sge: 6124 ctor st pack s, For |, 21 € ooa | Caseol®
009084 | 1567 Adult/ Catering use only. Approved Brands: La other than 10 CT/CASE pkga(:h% 1Dozen
Canasta # 1412328, Mission Tortilla # 24061 or an
approved equal. approved
Brand

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION ;\:ALYSIS QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
QUIRED CASES
Malone Meat & Poultry No bid
not approved brand Mama Lola's 114C $ 1.650 5/2Dz |$ 16.50 24 hrs
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods éﬁa?r';iitingm‘;%iﬁ $ 0178 | erapk | 25.58
CHEESE, CUBED VARIETY Only, if
Natural cheeses, cut into bite - sized cubes and packed bidding
Checkdo, suise, and poppor jac. Must b a stooked | 21 6 sct/sip) | CASEOF
011894 | 1600 |; o SWISS, and pepper jack. Hus other than 6 FIFTEEN | 1B
item. No special orders. Stored and shipped HACCP case POUNDS
required temperature. an
Approved Brands: Formando Schreiber # 13302 or approved
approved equal. Brand
Malone Meat & Poultry No bid
Mama Lola's No bid
AWARD VENDOR Shamrock Foods S::;}T::kd%&ﬁg%%ﬂ% .l 3480 3mb | 52.20
Only, if
TORTILLA, WHITE CORN WHOLE GRAIN bidding
White tortilla, made of whole grain corn masa an item CtaZT Zf
flour, 6" diameter, packed 12/ 24 ct/ case. One 288 CT We
013591 1660 . ) P . . other than 297 packages of | 1 EACH
tortilla provides 1 oz equiv grain toward NSLP CASE 24 ct per
meal pattern requirements. Approved Brands: an pkg.
Romero's # 160120 or approved equal. approved
Brand
AWARD VENDOR Malone Meat & Poultry Romero's 160120 $ 0.033 [12/2dozen| $ 9.41 | 14-21 days
Mama Lola's 402 ¢ $ 2.250 16/5 DZ $ 36.00 | 24 hours
Shamrock Foods No bid

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19
NUTRIENT ||[ESTIMATED
ITEM _||PURCHASE|| REQUIRED BID UNIT OR UNIT OR
NUMBER HORZ # ITEM DESCRIPTION/SPECIFICATION 2:35:;8;3 QUANTITY= PACK BID UNIT UNIT BRAND MFG# BID UNIT PRICE cASE pacKl cAsE PRICE LEAD TIME
CASES
APPLE SLICE, FRESH, PORTION CONTROL, 100 CT
Apple, Gala, red with skin on, sliced and packaged in Only, if
an easy-open, 2 ounce, clear bag, printing or artwork bidding
hpped and sored a ndusiy standerd refrigeratea | 2 6 202100 | G352 °f 100
012266 8002 temperature. State average shelf life of product and other than 1458 ct/case units of two 1 unit
. . . " - an ounces
pallet configuration in Special Conditions column.
Approved Brands: Tree Top, Fresh Innovations # approved
130121,# 130220, Peterson Farms or Approved Brand
Equal. Estimated usage dependent on USDA
commodity allocation.
Malone Meat & Poultry )
No bid
Mama Lola's
NO AWARD o
Shamrock Foods Markon MFG#11196
Shamrock Foods
#2199031 $ 0.318 |64/20z $ 20.33
HAM, SLICED Only, if
USDA Federally inspected ham, cured with honey or b'dd"
smoked seasonings, fully cooked, and sliced into .50 - I ) Ing
009842 | 1328 |87 ounce portions. D" shape portion. Sodium per two an item Case of 6
009879 | 1698 [0unce not to exceed 670 MG. Total fat per two ounce  |other than 25 6/2 #/CASE | units of 2 1LB
not to exceed 2 grams. Reddish pink color is an pounds each
consistent throughout with little fat. Pack size: 6/2 Ib.
Approved Brands: Perdue 75142, Hormel 39493 or aporovgd
approved equal. ran

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

Special Order

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

Special Order

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.



TUCSON UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS AND COST SHEETS PAGE 12 OF 18
FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19

SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

MUST STATE
LEAD TIME:

stocked

10,000 Ibs
minimum
mix/match
112 per
pallet

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.



TUCSON UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS AND COST SHEETS PAGE 15 OF 18
FOOD SERVICES PERISHABLE FOODS IFB #19-34-19

SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

MUST STATE
LEAD TIME:

10,000 Ib.
minimum
mis/match
72/pallet

5000 Ib
minimum

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

None

MUST STATE
LEAD TIME:

70 per pallet

None

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.
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SPECIAL
ORDER
CONDITIONS

SHELF LIFE
FROM DATE
OF MFG:
PALLET
CONFIGURATI
ON:

Shelf life from
date of MFG:
Pallet
Configuration:
Shelf Life 19
days 10x6

ESTIMATED QUANITITIES ARE PROVIDED AS AN ESTIMATE ONLY AND MAY CHANGE ACCORDING TO MENU REQUIREMENTS.



