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VENDING PRICE FORMAT:

Bidder must respond to a minimum of one proposed 

vending price level.  Bidder may also propose a 

third optional price level. 

Proposed Optional 

Vending Price: 

(fill in price) 

$ 1.00  12 ounce 

can,

$ 1.50 20 ounce 

bottle

ITEM
NUTRIENT 

ANALYSIS REQUIRED
BRAND

BRAND BRAND BRAND BRAND

SPECIFICATION REQUIRED BID UNIT COCA - COLA PEPSI COLA COCA - COLA PEPSI COLA PEPSI COLA 

VENDED 12oz CAN  CARBONATED SOFT DRINK

12oz CARBONATED SOFT DRINK.  CASE PRICE (VENDING 

SALES) STATE VARIETY OF FLAVORS AVAILABLE TO INCLUDE A 

REGULAR COLA AND LEMON - LIME FLAVOR AND A COLA AND 

LEMON - LIME FLAVOR SWEETENED WITH NATURAL NON-

CALORIC SWEETENER.

VENDED 20oz PLASTIC BOTTLE  CARBONATED SOFT DRINK

CARBONATED SOFT DRINK WITH RESEALABLE CAP.  NO 

DEPOSIT ON DELIVERY. CASE PRICE  (VENDING SALES) STATE 

VARIETY OF FLAVORS AVAILABLE TO INCLUDE A REGULAR 

COLA AND LEMON-LIME FLAVOR AND A COLA AND LEMON-LIME 

FLAVOR SWEETENED WITH NATURAL NON-CALORIC 

SWEETENER.

YES CS
COCA-COLA      

PRODUCTS

COCO-COLA      

PRODUCTS

PEPSI           

DIET PEPSI       

SIERRA MIST

VENDED 16-21 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLES WATER FOR DRINKING 

COMMISSION PERCENT (%)

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF 16-21oz BOTTLES.  VENDED AT $ 1.00 PER CAN 

OR $ 1.25 PER CAN, DEPENDING ON PRICING OPTION CHOSEN.    

Vending Price A:

$ 0.75 12 ounce can,

$ 1.00 20 ounce bottle

Vending Price B: 

$ 1.00 12 ounce can,

$ 1.25 20 ounce bottle

VENDED  16-21 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLE WATER FOR 

DRINKING

BOTTLED WATER WITH RESEALABLE CAP. NO DEPOSIT ON 

DELIVERY. CASE PRICE (VENDING)

STATE OUNCES: __________________

30%

30%

20%

COCA-COLA        

PRODUCTS

YES

N/A 35%

NO BID 35% 20%

AQUAFINA

35% 20%

DASANI

PEPSI             

DIET PEPSI       

SIERRA MIST

20%

CS
COCA-COLA        

PRODUCTS
 

25%

25%

DASANI

% OF 

SALES

VENDED 12 oz CAN CARBONATED SOFT DRINK COMMISSION 

PERCENT (%)                                                                            

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF 12 oz CAN. VENDED AT $ 0.75 PER CAN OR $ 1.00 

PER CAN, DEPENDING ON PRICING OPTION CHOSEN.   

% OF 

SALES
25%

VENDED 20oz PLASTIC BOTTLE CARBONATED SOFT DRINK 

COMMISSION PERCENT (%)                                                                    

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF 20oz BOTTLES.  VENDED AT $ 1.00 PER BTL OR   

$1.25 PER BTL, DEPENDING ON PRICING OPTION CHOSEN.   

N/A

YES

N/A

% OF 

SALES

CS

NO BID 

NO BID 
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VENDING PRICE FORMAT:

Bidder must respond to a minimum of one proposed 

vending price level.  Bidder may also propose a 

third optional price level. 

Proposed Optional 

Vending Price: 

(fill in price) 

$ 1.00  12 ounce 

can,

$ 1.50 20 ounce 

bottle

ITEM
NUTRIENT 

ANALYSIS REQUIRED
BRAND

BRAND BRAND BRAND BRAND

SPECIFICATION REQUIRED BID UNIT COCA - COLA PEPSI COLA COCA - COLA PEPSI COLA PEPSI COLA 

Vending Price A:

$ 0.75 12 ounce can,

$ 1.00 20 ounce bottle

Vending Price B: 

$ 1.00 12 ounce can,

$ 1.25 20 ounce bottle

VENDED  CAN 100% FRUIT JUICE

100% FRUIT JUICE IN CAN NOT TO EXCEED 12 OUNCES. CASE 

PRICE (VENDING). STATE VARIETY OF FLAVORS AVAILABLE.  

NUTRITIONAL ANALYSIS FOR ALL FLAVORS  MUST BE 

PROVIDED WITH BID PACKET SUBMISSION. 

STATE OUNCES: _______________________________

VENDED  CAN 100% FRUIT JUICE COMMISSION PERCENT (%)

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF CANS.  VENDED AT $0.75 PER CAN OR       $ 1.00 

PER CAN, DEPENDING ON PRICING OPTION CHOSEN.  

VENDED  16 - 20 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLE 100% FRUIT JUICE

100% FRUIT JUICE IN 16-20 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLE. CASE PRICE 

(VENDING). STATE VARIETY OF FLAVORS AVAILABLE.  

NUTRITIONAL ANALYSIS OF ALL FLAVORS MUST BE INCLUDED 

WITH BID PACKET SUBMISSION. 

         State Ounces  _____________

VENDED  16-20 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLE 100% FRUIT JUICE 

COMMISSION PERCENT (%)

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF 16-20 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLES.  VENDED AT $ 1.00 

PER BTL. OR $ 1.25 PER BTL., DEPENDING ON PRICING OPTION 

CHOSEN.  

30%

OCEAN SPRAY

35% 20%

OCEAN SPRAY
MINUTE MAID      

15.2 oz 

% OF 

SALES
25%

CS
MINUTE MAID      

15.2 oz 

% OF 

SALES

CS NO BID NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

YES

N/A

YES

N/A
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VENDING PRICE FORMAT:

Bidder must respond to a minimum of one proposed 

vending price level.  Bidder may also propose a 

third optional price level. 

Proposed Optional 

Vending Price: 

(fill in price) 

$ 1.00  12 ounce 

can,

$ 1.50 20 ounce 

bottle

ITEM
NUTRIENT 

ANALYSIS REQUIRED
BRAND

BRAND BRAND BRAND BRAND

SPECIFICATION REQUIRED BID UNIT COCA - COLA PEPSI COLA COCA - COLA PEPSI COLA PEPSI COLA 

Vending Price A:

$ 0.75 12 ounce can,

$ 1.00 20 ounce bottle

Vending Price B: 

$ 1.00 12 ounce can,

$ 1.25 20 ounce bottle

VENDED  6.5 OZ - 12 OZ SHELF STABLE DAIRY BEVERAGE 

DAIRY BEVERAGE OF ONLY 2% MILK FAT OR LOWER, SUGAR 

CONTENT NOT TO EXCEED 4 GRAMS OF SUGAR PER OUNCE IN 

FLAVORED MILK, SHELF STABLE, IN EASY OPEN PLASTIC WITH 

SCREW OFF REPLACEABLE LID OR ASEPTIC TYPE OF 

PACKAGING WITH STRAW. CASE PRICE (VENDING) STATE 

VARIETY OF FLAVORS AVAILABLE.  State Ounces __________ 

NUTRITIONAL ANALYSIS MUST BE PROVIDED WITH BID PACKET 

SUBMISSION. 

VENDED  6.5 - 12 OZ UNIT SHELF STABLE DAIRY BEVERAGE (%)

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF 6.5-12 OZ UNIT. VENDED AT $ 0.75 PER CAN OR   $ 

1.00 PER CAN, DEPENDING ON PRICING OPTION CHOSEN.  

VENDED 16 - 21 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLES SPORTS or ISOTONIC

SPORTS DRINK IN PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH RESEALABLE CAP.   

NO DEPOSIT ON DELIVERY.  CASE PRICE (VENDING). STATE 

OUNCES PER BOTTLE _______________  

VENDED 16-21 OUNCE PLASTIC BOTTLES SPORTS DRINK 

COMMISSION PERCENT (%)

PERCENT OF CASE RETURN FOR SERVICE TO VENDING 

MACHINES OF PLASTIC BOTTLES.  VENDED AT $ 1.00 PER 

BOTTLE OR $ 1.25 PER BOTTLE.   

20%25%

GATORADE
POWERADE        

20 OZ
GATORADECS

N/A
% OF 

SALES

NO BID 35%

35% 20%

25%              

CORE POWER
N/A NO BID

NO BID 

% OF 

SALES

YES

NO BID 

POWERADE        

20 OZ
YES

CORE POWERCORE POWERCS


