

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

1/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Fisher class representative Richardson email request regarding meeting with IC member Montano
1/2/2015	1.7	Reviewing Mendoza counsel Thompson first email request to budget expert Balentine regarding changes to TUSD desegregation budget and attached presentation and budgets
1/2/2015	0.3	Reviewing Mendoza counsel Thompson email to budget expert Balentine regarding changes to TUSD desegregation budget and attached TUSD narrative
1/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email response to Thompson email request regarding changes to TUSD desegregation budget
1/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email to TUSD interim director of desegregation Taylor regarding SM CRPI RFI
1/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM CRPI RFI
1/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email correction regarding SM CRPI RFI
1/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email response regarding SM CRPI RFI
1/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/5/2015	0.4	Reviewing document number 1661= SM request for approval of appointment of Payton to IC
1/5/2015	0.7	Reviewing TUSD counsel Tolleson email and attached ADE correspondence regarding TUSD noncompliance with ARS 15-112
1/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email to TUSD counsel Brown regarding further attachments to TUSD response to Mendoza annual report RFI
1/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email regarding budget process
1/6/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD draft response to Balentine report on budget process
1/6/2015	0.3	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached exhibit to ADE correspondence regarding TUSD noncompliance with ARS 15-112
1/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding revision of TUSD dropout prevention and graduation (DPG) plan
1/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding budget issues (carryover and reallocated funds)
1/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson preliminary email response regarding budget issues (carryover and reallocated funds)
1/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email to Hawley regarding scheduling meeting with IC member Montano
1/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding scheduling meeting with IC member Montano
1/7/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM 11/21/14 draft R&R on evaluation of student support programs
1/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email and linked TUSD responses to Mendoza annual report RFI
1/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email response regarding linked TUSD responses to Mendoza annual report RFI
1/7/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM directive to comply with plaintiff DPG, Duffy and budget RFIs
1/7/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD expert Rumberger 12/09/14 memorandum on TUSD DPG plan
1/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding TUSD expert Rumberger 12/09/14 memorandum on TUSD DPG plan
1/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/8/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1746 = Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email request regarding plaintiff stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/8/2015	1.6	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to SM CRPI RFI
1/8/2015	0.9	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD final proposal for allocation of carryover funds
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email response regarding stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email response regarding stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing DOJ counsel Eichner email stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD counsel Brammer email response regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1748 = Mendoza notice of errata in objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing text entry order approving appointment of Payton to IC
1/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding scheduling meeting with IC member Montano
1/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached December 2014 invoice
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email response regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email to Balentine regarding plaintiff stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email response regarding plaintiff stipulation to extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky automatic email notice of unavailability
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson emails regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer emails regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/12/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher position on TUSD final proposal for allocation of carryover funds
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding Fisher position on TUSD final proposal for allocation of carryover funds
1/12/2015	0.1	Drafting email reply regarding Fisher position on TUSD final proposal for allocation of carryover funds
1/12/2015	0.2	Drafting email objection to proposed extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response regarding Fisher objection to proposed extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/12/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza position on revised scope of the 2013-2014 budget audit
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding scheduling meeting with IC member Montano
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Fisher representatives’ position on TUSD final proposal for allocation of carryover funds
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding budgeting 910 (g) funds for OCR compliance at Duffy
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Bury JA Barkley email regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email response regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email reply regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/13/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Hawley regarding meeting with IC member Montano
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding meeting with IC member Montano
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email to Barkely regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/14/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Richardson regarding meeting with IC member Montano
1/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding briefing schedule for Mendoza objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1750 = TUSD response regarding SM GSRR R&R
1/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/14/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1751 = TUSD motion for extension of submission of 2013-2014 budget audit
1/14/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Richardson regarding scheduling meeting with SM
1/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email response regarding scheduling meeting with SM
1/14/2015	2	Drafting final Fisher objection to CRPI appointment
1/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding upcoming summit
1/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding upcoming summit
1/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email response regarding upcoming summit
1/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding upcoming summit
1/15/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher position on TUSD final proposal for allocation of carryover funds
1/15/2015	2	Reviewing Brammer email and attached TUSD 2015 plan for implementing CRCs
1/15/2015	1	Continuing to draft final Fisher objection to CRPI appointment
1/15/2015	0.1	Drafting email to counsel regarding attached final Fisher objection to CRPI appointment
1/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum to Bury regarding proposed district-wide funding of leveled reading program
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding receipt of final Fisher objection to CRPI appointment
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Fisher objection to proposed allocation of carryover funds
1/16/2015	0.1	Drafting email reply regarding Fisher objection to proposed allocation of carryover funds
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding Fisher objection to proposed allocation of carryover funds
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1752 = court order granting motion for extension of time to respond to GSRR R&R
1/16/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1753 = court order adopting in part and denying in part SM CMP R&R
1/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1754 = SM objection to proposed district-wide funding of leveled reading program
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email inquiry regarding circulation of student support program documents
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding circulation of student support program documents
1/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Mendoza RFI regarding revised scope of the 2013-2014 budget audit
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email response regarding agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/16/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding SM objection to proposed district-wide funding of leveled reading program
1/16/2015	1.5	Drafting Fisher response and RFI regarding SM objection to proposed district-wide funding of leveled reading program
1/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email to Hawley regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/16/2015	0.9	Reviewing Brammer email and attached student support program document (framework for comprehensive evaluation plan)
1/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email response regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/18/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum reply to Fisher response and RFI regarding SM objection to proposed district-wide funding of leveled reading program
1/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Bhargava email regarding agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/19/2015	1.9	Reviewing Hawley email and attached professional development documents
1/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Bhargava email regarding agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/20/2015	4	Participating in summit
1/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached agenda for 01/20/15 summit
1/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor emails and attached budget auditor responses
1/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email and linked description of learning support coordinators
1/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached CRC offerings
1/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher objection to proposed allocation of carryover funds
1/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson follow-up email RFI regarding 2013-2014 USP budget audit
1/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Montano email regarding meeting with Fisher representatives
1/21/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding meeting with Montano
1/21/2015	0.5	Reviewing Tolleson emails and attached AIMS scores by race and ethnicity and school
1/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD Chief Financial Officer Karla Soto preliminary email response to Mendoza RFI regarding 2013-2014 USP budget audit

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

1/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding AA history course offering at Sahuaro HS
1/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding timeliness of SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/22/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD GB minutes regarding additions of Ochoa and Robison as magnets
1/22/2015	2.2	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD response to SM Duffy RFI and TUSD OCR agreement
1/22/2015	0.7	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown emails regarding attachments to TUSD RFI response
1/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/23/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached draft of SM response to 01/16/15 order
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email response regarding SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email request regarding exhibits to SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding exhibits to SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email reply regarding exhibits to SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email request regarding upload of post RFI responses to password protected site
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached exhibits to SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson and Holmes emails and attached updated list of CRCs
1/23/2015	0.8	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Mendoza comments on revised TUSD DPG plan
1/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding dates for March summit
1/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email response regarding dates for March summit
1/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding reported TUSD GB consideration of plans to change grade configuration at Fruchthendler ES and Sabino HS
1/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/26/2015	0.9	Reviewing document number 1756= TUSD response to Mendoza corrected objection to TUSD 12/29/14 revised USP budget
1/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
1/26/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached master list for CRCs and MCs
1/26/2015	1.6	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD response to Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
1/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley emails regarding possible change in grade structures at Fruchthendler ES and Sabino HS
1/26/2015	0.1	Drafting email response to Hawley email regarding Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
1/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
1/26/2015	0.3	Drafting email RFI regarding possible change in grade structures at Fruchthendler ES and Sabino HS
1/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email response regarding Fisher RFI regarding possible change in grade structures at Fruchthendler ES and Sabino HS
1/26/2015	1.8	Drafting Fisher objection to SM R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/26/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding Fisher objection to SM R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding dates for March summit
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley emails regarding dates for March summit
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding dates for March summit
1/27/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding dates for March summit
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer emails regarding dates for March summit
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding DOJ position on allocation of carry-over funds
1/27/2015	1.4	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD response to SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Fisher objection to SM R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding DOJ position on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding dates for March summit
1/27/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza position on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza reply to TUSD response to SM draft R&R on proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding TUSD GB presentation regarding possible change in grade structures at Fruchthendler ES and Sabino HS
1/28/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1757 = court order adopting briefing schedule
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1758 = court order granting motion for extension of time to file budget documents
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1759 = court order granting motion for extension of time to submit budget audit report to SM
1/28/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Fisher desegregation budget audit RFI
1/28/2015	1.3	Drafting Fisher comments on SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/28/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding Fisher comments on SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding discussion of audit with TUSD staff Karla Soto
1/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley preliminary email response regarding Fisher comments on SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding Mendoza comments on SM response to 01/16/15 order
1/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Mendoza comments on SM response to 01/16/15 order

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

1/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding Fisher comments on SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Fisher comments on SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
1/30/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1760 = court order adopting SM second amended teacher and principal evaluation R&R
1/30/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1761 = TUSD stipulation regarding implementation of CRCs
1/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email inquiry regarding party positions on SM memorandum regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/30/2015	0.2	Drafting Fisher email RFI regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley preliminary email response to Fisher email RFI regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email update on status of SM and Balentine consultation with TUSD regarding development of teacher and principal evaluation procedures
1/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown preliminary email response to Fisher email RFI regarding proposed allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
1/30/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised schedule for revised TUSD CMP
1/30/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached revised DP&G plan
2/1/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM analysis of professional development cost calculations
2/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding bilingual instruction at Roskrige MS and enrollment of AA students in CRCs at Catalina and Rincon HSS
2/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
2/2/2015	0.1	Drafting Fisher email RFI regarding bilingual instruction at Roskrige MS and enrollment of AA students in CRCs at Catalina and Rincon HSS
2/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email response regarding bilingual instruction at Roskrige MS and enrollment of AA students in CRCs at Catalina and Rincon HSS
2/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email response regarding bilingual instruction at Roskrige MS and enrollment of AA students in CRCs at Catalina and Rincon HSS
2/2/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD comprehensive evaluation plan
2/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding TUSD comprehensive evaluation plan
2/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Soto email update regarding status of USP budget audit
2/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email update regarding status of USP budget audit
2/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum of understanding (MOM) regarding allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
2/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on revision of CMP
2/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Balentine email and attached recommendations regarding USP budget audit
2/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding time to object to TUSD comprehensive evaluation plan
2/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding time to object to TUSD comprehensive evaluation plan
2/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/4/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1763 = TUSD notice regarding filing of SM report on student support programs
2/4/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1762 = TUSD notice regarding filing of budget review criteria and process
2/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding possible meeting with members of AAAATF regarding USP
2/4/2015	0.2	Drafting email response regarding possible meeting with members of AAAATF regarding USP
2/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson preliminary email response regarding possible meeting with members of AAAATF regarding USP
2/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article on bill to eliminate desegregation funding
2/5/2015	0.3	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on TUSD revised DP&G plan
2/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing first Brown email regarding GSRR
2/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing second Brown email regarding GSRR
2/8/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum regarding Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
2/8/2015	1.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD memorandum response to SM CRPI comments
2/8/2015	0.6	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD memorandum response to SM CRPI RFI
2/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum regarding TUSD noncompliance with implementation of CRCs
2/9/2015	1.1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD Fruchthendler/Sabino DIA documents
2/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding TUSD Fruchthendler/Sabino DIA documents
2/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding party resolution of allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
2/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding meeting with AAAATF
2/11/2015	0.2	Drafting email response regarding meeting with AAAATF
2/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1766 = SM notice of withdrawal of objection (document number 1754)
2/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1767 = SM notice of concurrence with Mendoza request (document number 1761)
2/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email reply regarding meeting with AAAATF
2/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1768 = court order approving implementation of CRCs
2/12/2015	0.7	Reviewing Schelble email and linked TUSD GB 01/27/15 meeting presentation on Fruchthendler/Sabino grade changes
2/12/2015	0.5	Researching TUSD enrollment statistics for Fruchthendler, Magee and Sabino
2/12/2015	1	Drafting Fisher email objection to and request for SM R&R on planned grade changes at Fruchthendler/Sabino
2/12/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to planned grade changes at Fruchthendler/Sabino
2/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher email objection to and request for SM R&R on planned grade changes at Fruchthendler/Sabino
2/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/13/2015	2.3	Reviewing document number 1770 = TUSD notice regarding nunc pro tunc filing of revised IA
2/13/2015	0.7	Reviewing document number 1771 = court order approving implementation of CRCs
2/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request regarding possible meeting between Fisher representatives and SM

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

2/13/2015	0.1	Drafting email reply regarding Fisher email objection to and request for SM R&R on planned grade changes at Fruchthendler/Sabino
2/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding Fisher email objection to and request for SM R&R on planned grade changes at Fruchthendler/Sabino
2/13/2015	0.2	Drafting email response regarding possible meeting between Fisher representatives and SM
2/15/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on USP budget process
2/15/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM objections to TUSD 2014-2015 comprehensive evaluation plan (CEP)
2/15/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM invoice for January 2015
2/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding email communication protocol between parties
2/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding email communications with TUSD counsel Tolleson
2/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding time to file IA
2/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1772 = TUSD notice of association of counsel Brown
2/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email response regarding time to file IA
2/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding time to file IA
2/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email response regarding time to file IA
2/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza objections to TUSD 2014-2015 comprehensive evaluation plan (CEP)
2/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email response regarding SM comments on USP budget process
2/17/2015	0.3	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza objection to and request for SM R&R on planned grade changes at Fruchthendler/Sabino
2/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding AAAATF meeting
2/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email to Sanchez regarding SM CEP MOU
2/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised SM CEP MOU
2/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky and Thompson emails regarding SM CEP MOU
2/19/2015	1.5	Reviewing Brammer email and attached TUSD principal and teacher evaluation plans
2/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson, Hawley and Savitsky emails regarding TUSD budget process
2/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD memorandum response to SM comments on TUSD revised DPG plan
2/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1773 = Mendoza response to TUSD notice regarding filing of SM report on student support programs (document number 1763)
2/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher satisfaction with amended CEP
2/20/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Richardson regarding AAAATF meeting
2/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Fisher satisfaction with amended CEP
2/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached corrected SM invoice for January 2015
2/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding IC inquiry into reported disproportionate suspension rates at Erickson ES, Utterback MS and Palo Verde HS
2/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM update on status of CMP process
2/20/2015	0.9	Reviewing Brown email and attached 2013-2014 USP budget audit report
2/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding TUSD principal and teacher evaluation plans
2/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/20/2015	0.3	Reviewing document number 1774 = court order approving revised 2014-2015 desegregation budget
2/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Campoy letter to Arizona Senate Finance Committee regarding SB 1371 to end state funding for desegregation compliance
2/22/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM draft CRPI R&R
2/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised SM draft CRPI R&R
2/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding exhibits to revised SM draft CRPI R&R
2/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding exhibits to revised SM draft CRPI R&R
2/23/2015	0.3	Drafting email request for IC inquiry into disproportionate suspensions at Erikson ES, Utterback MS, Palo Verde HS and Saguaro HS
2/23/2015	0.1	Consulting with class representative regarding order governing time to respond to SM R&Rs
2/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding IC inquiry into disproportionate suspensions at Erikson ES, Utterback MS, Palo Verde HS and Saguaro HS
2/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding bilingual instruction at Roskrige MS and enrollment of AA students in CRCs at Catalina HS
2/25/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached quarterly report of changes in desegregation allocations for FY 2014-2015
2/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email response regarding inadequacy of quarterly report of changes in desegregation allocations for FY 2014-2015
2/25/2015	1.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on TUSD TEP and Hawley-Irvine article on evaluation of teacher effectiveness
2/25/2015	0.2	Consulting with Richardson regarding AAAATF meeting
2/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/25/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1775 = SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
2/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine emails regarding concerns with quarterly report of changes in desegregation allocations for FY 2014-2015
2/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email response regarding concerns with quarterly report of changes in desegregation allocations for FY 2014-2015
2/25/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble emails and linked articles regarding AIMS testing
2/25/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and attached a PDF copy of SB1191
2/25/2015	1.3	Researching Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
2/25/2015	1.2	Drafting Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
2/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/26/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1776 = TUSD reply to Mendoza response to TUSD notice regarding filing of SM report on student support programs
2/26/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM and Balentine comments on TUSD PEP
2/26/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

2/26/2015	0.6	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
2/26/2015	1.9	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
2/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
2/27/2015	1.6	Reviewing document number 1777 = TUSD notice regarding filing of multi-year facilities plan
2/27/2015	1.4	Reviewing document number 1778 = TUSD notice regarding filing of multi-year technology plan
2/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding filing of TUSD multi-year facilities and technology plans
2/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding filing of TUSD multi-year facilities and technology plans
2/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding filing of TUSD multi-year facilities and technology plans
2/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding filing of TUSD multi-year facilities and technology plans
2/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding filing of TUSD multi-year facilities and technology plans
2/27/2015	0.9	Reviewing Brammer email and attached desegregation budget and summary for 2015-2016 SY
2/27/2015	1.8	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
2/27/2015	2.2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding concerns with quarterly report of changes in desegregation allocations for FY 2014-2015
3/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email to Balentine regarding desegregation budget and summary for 2015-2016 SY
3/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email response regarding desegregation budget and summary for 2015-2016 SY
3/1/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/1/2015	1.4	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Richardson email and attached letter to Sanchez regarding suspension of AA students at Sahuaro HS
3/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached Balentine invoices for January and February 2015
3/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Sanchez email acknowledgement of receipt of letter regarding suspension of AA students at Sahuaro HS
3/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email and attached AAAATF member contact information
3/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/2/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding email invitation to 03/17/15 meeting with AAAATF
3/2/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Hawley regarding suspension of AA students at Sahuaro HS
3/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email response regarding Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/2/2015	0.8	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/2/2015	1.2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM and Balentine evaluation of TUSD professional development (PD) expenditures
3/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM initial comments on TUSD desegregation budget report
3/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM invoice for February 2015
3/3/2015	1.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/3/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing UA Law professor Andrew Silverman email regarding meeting with TUSD parents
3/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/4/2015	2.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD NARA and response to the Fisher and Mendoza objections to grade expansions at Fruchthendler ES and Sabino HS
3/4/2015	0.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/4/2015	1	Finalizing Fisher objection to SM response to Fisher objection to and request for SM CRPI R&R
3/5/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to SM RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/5/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM reply to TUSD responses to SM RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/5/2015	2.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD 20% rule report and the ELL supplement to ALE action plan report required by court (document number 1771)
3/5/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD NARA/DIA/response to plaintiff objections and request for SM R&R on Sabino/Fruchthendler grade changes
3/5/2015	0.2	Drafting email inquiry regarding procedural standing of requested Fisher Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
3/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding procedural standing of requested Fisher Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
3/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding TUSD MS director Michael Konrad invitation to participate in ALE committee
3/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email recommendation regarding plaintiff feedback on TUSD budget
3/6/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding TUSD MS director Michael Konrad invitation to participate in ALE committee
3/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email request regarding plaintiff waiver of April budget meeting
3/6/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email update regarding budget process and attached master activity list spreadsheet
3/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email response to SM budget RFI and attached proposed school staffing and funding formulas and fund descriptions
3/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding invitation to participate in ALE committee
3/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding invitation to participate in ALE committee
3/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Konrad email regarding invitation to participate in ALE committee
3/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email response to SM objections to TUSD 2014-2015 CEP
3/9/2015	0.3	Drafting email to TUSD counsel Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email response regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
3/9/2015	0.1	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email waiver of April budget meeting
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email inquiry regarding DOJ and Fisher waiver of April budget meeting
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email waiver of April budget meeting
3/9/2015	0.2	Reviewing Richardson email and attached letter regarding TUSD disciplinary hearings
3/9/2015	0.1	Drafting Fisher email waiver of April budget meeting
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding plaintiff waiver of April budget meeting
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing first TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing second TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing third TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding possible violation of GSRR at TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson third email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes first email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes second email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes third email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing fourth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	2.2	Reviewing Brammer email and attached multi-year facilities plan and exhibits thereto
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson fourth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing fifth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email inquiry regarding procedural standing of SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding procedural standing of SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
3/10/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD responses to SM comments on budget review process
3/10/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum regarding disputed claims in Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
3/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached draft agenda for 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes fourth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes fifth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor second email response to SM objections to TUSD 2014-2015 CEP
3/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing sixth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/12/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD responses to SM comments on budget review process
3/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding draft agenda for 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing seventh TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson fifth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/13/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD revised PD cost assessment
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing eighth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson sixth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/13/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD re-revised PD plan and responses to Mendoza comments
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email renewal of Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing ninth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response to Thompson email renewal of Mendoza RFI regarding desegregation budget report
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson seventh email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing tenth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/15/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM response to TUSD re-revised PD plan
3/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised draft agenda for 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding AAAATF meeting/reception
3/16/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding AAAATF meeting/reception
3/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
3/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1780 = SM response regarding disputed claims in Fisher request for SM CRPI R&R
3/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1781 = SM notice regarding schedule for provision of magnet status monitoring information
3/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding revised draft agenda for 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson eighth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding AAAATF meeting/reception
3/18/2015	1.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to SM and Mendoza desegregation budget audit RFI
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding meeting with Fisher representatives
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing eleventh TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson ninth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing twelfth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson tenth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson eleventh email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing thirteenth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum regarding USP magnet provisions
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson twelfth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing fourteenth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on TUSD TEP
3/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on TUSD PEP
3/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised draft agenda for 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/20/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Hawley regarding possible meeting with Fisher representatives
3/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on TUSD responses to SM and Mendoza desegregation budget audit RFI
3/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes sixth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD legal staff Mary Elenes seventh email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised draft agenda for 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing fifteenth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding participation in 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/23/2015	2.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached 2015-2016 desegregation budget and supplemental memorandum
3/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding forthcoming revision of supplemental memorandum
3/24/2015	1.4	Continuing to review 2015-2016 desegregation budget and supplemental memorandum
3/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD desegregation department staff member Sonia Gissart update regarding 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza participation in 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson thirteenth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
3/25/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached revised supplemental memorandum
3/25/2015	1	Continuing to review 2015-2016 desegregation budget
3/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown, Savitsky and Eichner emails regarding participation in 03/26/15-03/27/15 meeting
3/26/2015	6	Participating in desegregation summit meeting
3/26/2015	1	Continuing to review 2015-2016 desegregation budget and revised supplemental memorandum
3/26/2015	1.1	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached comprehensive goals for attaining unitary status
3/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding Richardson
3/27/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached desegregation PowerPoint presentation
3/27/2015	7.5	Participating in desegregation summit meeting
3/27/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached elementary magnet school plans
3/27/2015	0.6	Reviewing Taylor email and attached middle magnet school plans
3/27/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached high magnet school plans
3/27/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached desegregation reallocation plan spreadsheet
3/27/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached discipline data
3/27/2015	0.5	Continuing to review comprehensive goals for attaining unitary status
3/27/2015	0.5	Continuing to review 2015-2016 desegregation budget and revised supplemental memorandum
4/1/2015	0.4	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza concerns with disciplinary issues at Safford K-8 MS and attached Safford K-8 MS plan
4/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing sixteenth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
4/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson fourteenth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1785 = Mendoza notification of withdrawal of attorneys Strieker and Valenzuela Dixon
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding Mendoza concerns with disciplinary issues at Safford K-8 MS
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding Mendoza concerns with disciplinary issues at Safford K-8 MS
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding submission of SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Learning Support Coordinator (LSC) positions and meeting with TUSD Senior Director of Professional Development Richard Foster
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearings
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing seventeenth TUSD parent email to Tolleson regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
4/2/2015	1.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on individual magnet school improvement plans
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson fifteenth email regarding TUSD disciplinary hearing
4/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for LSC RFI
4/2/2015	0.2	Drafting email request to SM regarding disproportionate disciplinary rates for AA students at Sahuaro HS and LSC positions
4/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding disproportionate disciplinary rates for AA students at Sahuaro HS and LSC positions
4/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email renewal of Mendoza ALE RFIs
4/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response regarding renewal of Mendoza ALE RFIs
4/3/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD teacher evaluation plan (TEP) and principal evaluation plan (PEP)
4/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
4/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1787 = DOJ notification of attorney substitution
4/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email and attached RFI form
4/6/2015	0.3	Drafting email and attached LSC RFI
4/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached Balentine invoice for March 2015

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

4/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown preliminary email response to Fisher LSC RFI
4/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza 04/07/15 objection to TUSD ELL supplement to ALE plan
4/7/2015	1.4	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza supplemental objection to TUSD Sabino/Fruchthendler grade changes
4/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Mendoza supplemental objection to TUSD Sabino/Fruchthendler grade changes
4/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email request regarding Fisher objection to and request for SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/8/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher objection to and request for SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Fisher objection to and request for SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/8/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to ALE RFIs
4/8/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM summary of forthcoming Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding DOJ response to SM summary of forthcoming Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/9/2015	0.3	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza 04/09/15 comments on TUSD multi-year facilities plan (MYFP)
4/10/2015	0.3	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza 04/10/15 comments on ALE goals
4/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding multicultural coordinator (MC) positions
4/10/2015	0.2	Drafting conditional email concurrence with SM proposal regarding Sabino/Fruchthendler grade changes
4/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding Fisher conditional email concurrence with SM proposal regarding Sabino/Fruchthendler grade changes
4/10/2015	0.6	Reviewing Hawley email and attached draft of SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/10/2015	0.4	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza 04/10/15 comments on TUSD revised TE and PE plans
4/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding TUSD TE and PE plans and instruments
4/14/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to Fisher LSC RFI
4/14/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD responses to Fisher LSC RFI
4/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
4/14/2015	1.2	Reviewing document number 1787 = DOJ notification of attorney substitution
4/14/2015	1.3	Reviewing document number 1789 = TUSD Sabino/Fruchthendler NARA
4/14/2015	1.8	Reviewing document number 1788 = TUSD notice regarding filing of ALE action plan supplement
4/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached SM invoice for March 2015
4/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
4/15/2015	1.1	Reviewing document number 1790 = SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/15/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner second email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fourth email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fifth email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	2.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/16/2015	2.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for GSRR RFI
4/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding status of desegregation budget RFI
4/17/2015	1.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/17/2015	1.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/18/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/18/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/19/2015	2.8	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/19/2015	2.7	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/20/2015	2.2	Researching record below for references to members / representatives of Fisher Plaintiff class
4/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing correspondence forwarded by Bury regarding role / status of members / representatives of Fisher Plaintiff class
4/20/2015	1	Consulting with class representatives regarding correspondence forwarded by Bury regarding role / status of members / representatives of Fisher Plaintiff class
4/20/2015	1.1	Compiling summary of excerpted references to members / representatives of Fisher Plaintiff class
4/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding regarding role / status of members / representatives of Fisher Plaintiff class
4/20/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

4/20/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding possible allocation of desegregations to relocate portables to Dietz ES
4/21/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email invitation and attached agenda for District Management Council (DMC) workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
4/21/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email regarding PE process
4/21/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding Dietz NARA
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Dietz NARA
4/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson second email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/21/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/21/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson third email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/22/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Taylor regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor second email regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley sixth email regarding expedited briefing schedule for responses to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/22/2015	1.8	Reviewing Hawley email and attached teaching evaluation instrument
4/22/2015	0.4	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request to TUSD Assistant Superintendent of E and K-8 Leadership Steven Holmes
4/22/2015	2.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/22/2015	2.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
4/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD supplemental response to ALE RFI
4/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding GSRR RFI
4/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
4/23/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1792 = TUSD objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/23/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1793 = DOJ objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/23/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1794 = Mendoza objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/23/2015	3	Continuing to research Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/23/2015	3	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to SM Sabino/Fruchthendler R&R
4/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/24/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/24/2015	0.2	Drafting Fisher Dietz RFI
4/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Langford email regarding TUSD responses to TUSD responses to Fisher LSC RFI
4/27/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum regarding National Panel on Culturally Responsive Curriculum and Instruction (NPCRCI)
4/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding SM replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding SM replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for desegregation budget RFI
4/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky second email regarding SM replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/27/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
4/27/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum update regarding consultation on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding SM replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/27/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/28/2015	0.2	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding SM replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
4/28/2015	0.2	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/28/2015	1.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to ALE, MASS, GATE, FACE plan, AP enrollment, UHS and desegregation budget RFIs
4/28/2015	0.2	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding ALE, MASS, GATE, FACE plan, AP enrollment, UHS and desegregation budget RFIs
4/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Fisher Dietz RFI
4/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
4/28/2015	1.2	Reviewing document number 1795 = Mendoza objection to TUSD notice regarding filing of TUSD ALE action plan supplement
4/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/29/2015	0.2	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD response to Fisher Dietz RFI
4/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

4/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/29/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding draft of 2015-16 desegregation budget
4/30/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
5/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor third email regarding DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
5/1/2015	1.8	Reviewing Hawley email and attached expert Jaqueline Jordan Irvine feedback and SM memorandum regarding TUSD TE and PE instruments / plans
5/1/2015	1	Reviewing Brammer email and attached TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding authority controlling relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM concerns with DMC workshop on definition / role of LSCs
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding DOJ replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response regarding DOJ replies to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TE and PE instruments / plans
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/4/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD DMC workshop presentation on definition / role of LSCs
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding TUSD DMC workshop presentation on definition / role of LSCs
5/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/5/2015	0.2	Drafting email response to Richardson regarding TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
5/5/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1797 = TUSD reply regarding Mendoza objection to TUSD notice regarding filing of TUSD ALE action plan supplement
5/5/2015	0.4	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/5/2015	2	Researching Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/5/2015	2.2	Drafting Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email request for update on allocation of carry-over desegregation funds
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding TUSD adoption of Mendoza 04/09/15 comments on TUSD MYFP
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	1.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity
5/6/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum on use of student surveys in teacher evaluation
5/6/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD response to SM / DOJ RFI regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine first email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached Jacqueline Jordan Irvine and Beatriz Arias revision of / comments on TUSD TEI
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson second email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson third email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson fourth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fourth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine second email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson fifth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine third email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding AA candidates for TUSD administrative positions
5/6/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/6/2015	1.6	Continuing to draft Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson fifth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fifth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky second email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson sixth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson seventh email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.6	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza 05/07/15 comments on / RFI regarding TUSD 2015-16 desegregation budget
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding Mendoza 05/07/15 comments on / RFI regarding TUSD 2015-16 desegregation budget

Table 1. Statement of attorney's fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

5/7/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/7/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/7/2015	0.1	Drafting email with attached Fisher reply to TUSD responses to plaintiff comments on TUSD memorandum and DIA regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding TUSD 2015-16 desegregation budget
5/7/2015	0.3	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding relocation of portables to Dietz ES and attached TUSD GB agenda
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached Balentine invoice for April 2015
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for UHS RFI
5/7/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM invoice for April 2015
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine fourth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson eighth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson ninth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner second email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez second email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley sixth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson tenth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine fifth email regarding IC expenditure review summary by implementation activity (teleconference)
5/8/2015	0.5	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding TUSD Dietz NARA and attachments thereto
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding TUSD Dietz NARA
5/8/2015	0.9	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD desegregation professional development (PD) plans
5/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
5/8/2015	0.7	Reviewing document number 1798 = TUSD Dietz NARA
5/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding long-term suspension of AA students at Sahuaro HS
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM RFI regarding TUSD 2015-16 desegregation budget
5/11/2015	0.3	Drafting Fisher UHS RFI
5/11/2015	0.1	Drafting email with attached Fisher UHS RFI
5/11/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding teleconference regarding IC activity
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding proposed schedule for Dietz NARA
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding teleconference regarding IC activity
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding proposed schedule for Dietz NARA
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding proposed schedule for Dietz NARA
5/11/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum and comments on TUSD CMP
5/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email comments on individual MS improvement plans
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding reduced access to information on the TUSD website
5/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown follow-up email regarding TUSD proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding reduced access to information on the TUSD website
5/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson second email regarding reduced access to information on the TUSD website
5/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
5/12/2015	0.4	Reviewing document number 1799 = court order denying TUSD Sabino/Fruchthendler NARA
5/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding reduced access to information on the TUSD website
5/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding TUSD proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding reduced access to information on the TUSD website
5/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding TUSD multicultural education coordinator
5/13/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email response to Waterkotte email regarding TUSD Dietz NARA
5/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding reduced access to information on the TUSD website
5/13/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Balentine regarding TUSD multicultural education coordinator
5/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding hiring freeze and transportation issues
5/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email regarding hiring freeze and transportation issues
5/13/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding preliminary analysis of TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/13/2015	3	Researching Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/13/2015	1	Drafting Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding multicultural coordinator position
5/14/2015	2.2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/14/2015	1.8	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/14/2015	0.4	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding meetings with expert Peterkin, AAAATF and Fisher representatives
5/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding proposed schedule for Dietz NARA
5/14/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding USP provisions for AAAATF
5/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/14/2015	0.5	Drafting email and attached Fisher hiring freeze and transportation RFIs
5/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza objection to TUSD announcement of Santa Rita early college

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

5/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding Mendoza objection to TUSD announcement of Santa Rita early college
5/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Sanchez email regarding Mendoza objection to TUSD announcement of Santa Rita early college
5/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Mendoza objection to TUSD announcement of Santa Rita early college
5/15/2015	2.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/15/2015	1.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/15/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/15/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor preliminary email response regarding Fisher hiring freeze and transportation RFIs
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
5/15/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1800 = DOJ notice of no objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/15/2015	0.9	Reviewing document number 1801 = Mendoza objection to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1803 = TUSD notice of filing CMP
5/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/15/2015	1.8	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to Mendoza desegregation budget RFI
5/16/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised SM memorandum proposal for CMP process
5/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD responses to Mendoza desegregation budget RFI
5/17/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached revised CMP briefing schedule
5/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding TUSD responses to Mendoza desegregation budget RFI
5/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Fisher budget RFI and meeting with Taylor
5/17/2015	1.7	Reviewing TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/17/2015	0.5	Researching Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/17/2015	0.2	Drafting Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request regarding TUSD interviews for Director of Desegregation
5/17/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher comments on / objections to TUSD revised CMP / individual school improvement plans
5/17/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on TUSD revised CMP
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding proposed desegregation budget process schedule
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding proposed desegregation budget process schedule
5/18/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum summary of forthcoming SM Dietz R&R
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez regarding revised CMP briefing schedule
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/18/2015	0.1	Drafting Fisher email request for meeting to discuss budget
5/18/2015	0.3	Drafting email and attached Fisher Director of Desegregation RFI
5/18/2015	0.2	Drafting email and attached amended Fisher Director of Desegregation RFI
5/18/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached student support forms
5/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email request for redline copy of revised desegregation budget
5/19/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley emails and attached SM comments on TUSD desegregation budget
5/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing TUSD Chief Human Resources Officer Anna Maiden email response to amended Fisher Director of Desegregation RFI
5/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/20/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached supplemental TUSD response to ALE and DPG plan RFI
5/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor preliminary email response to Fisher email request for meeting to discuss budget
5/20/2015	0.2	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD response to ALE and DPG plan RFI and budget meeting
5/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/21/2015	0.5	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/22/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/22/2015	1.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/22/2015	1.2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky second email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez second email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/22/2015	0.3	Drafting email to Orfield regarding expert feedback on TUSD CMP
5/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
5/22/2015	1.2	Reviewing document number 1804 = TUSD reply to plaintiff objections to TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

5/23/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/23/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/23/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/24/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/24/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/24/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/25/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/25/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/25/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/26/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/26/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/26/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/26/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Fisher UHS RFI
5/26/2015	0.5	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD response to Fisher UHS RFI
5/26/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached FY 2015 3rd quarter desegregation expenditure (DE) report
5/27/2015	0.9	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/27/2015	1.6	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/27/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
5/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
5/27/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1805 = SM R&R on TUSD 05/08/15 Dietz NARA
5/28/2015	1.5	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/28/2015	1.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/28/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/28/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Montano magnet transportation RFI
5/28/2015	1	Consulting with Fisher class representatives regarding Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/28/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached GSRR revised for 2015-16 SY
5/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding possible meeting in Tucson
5/28/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD responses to Fisher multicultural curriculum director RFI
5/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email response to SM AA math tutoring RFI
5/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown third email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools and attached revised GB policy JFB
5/28/2015	0.6	Reviewing Brown email and attached revised TUSD TEI and growth point model
5/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley fourth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools and attached SM memorandum
5/29/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/29/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/29/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/29/2015	0.5	Drafting email and attached Fisher CMP RFI
5/29/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD response to Fisher hiring freeze RFI
5/29/2015	0.3	Drafting email and attached Fisher multicultural director assistant RFI
5/29/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD response to behavioral specialist RFI
5/29/2015	0.8	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on / objections to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/30/2015	0.1	Drafting email correction regarding Fisher objection to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
5/31/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM reply to plaintiff comments on / objections to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
6/1/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fifth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
6/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez third email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
6/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley sixth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
6/2/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown email and attached PEI
6/2/2015	1.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD responses to certificated staff RFI
6/2/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM reply to plaintiff comments on / objections to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown fourth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools and attached revised GB policy JFB
6/2/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown email and attachments regarding TUSD response to Fisher desegregation budget RFI
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding TUSD response to SM carry-over desegregation funds RFI
6/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD AA CRC schedule
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD responses to certificated staff RFI
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding TUSD responses to certificated staff RFI
6/2/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM reply to plaintiff comments on / objections to TUSD 05/15/15 CMP and individual school improvement plans

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez fourth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley seventh email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email regarding gap between Arizona and national per pupil funding ratios
6/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown fifth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools and attached revised GB policy JFB
6/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding update on TUSD desegregation budget process
6/3/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding TUSD responses to certificated staff RFI
6/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools
6/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding TEI
6/4/2015	0.4	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on TUSD 2015-16 FY desegregation budget
6/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding TEI
6/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding TUSD summer business hours
6/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding TUSD summer business hours
6/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding TUSD staff summer schedule
6/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding TUSD staff summer schedule
6/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email request regarding 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown sixth email regarding proposed change to admissions processes for oversubscribed / magnet schools and attached revised GB policy JFB
6/8/2015	0.6	Reviewing Hawley email and attached TUSD CRC implementation / intervention plan report
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response regarding 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Fisher representatives’ position on AA CRCs
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for Fisher desegregation budget RFI
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response to SM comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding TUSD TEI and PEI
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez preliminary email reply to TUSD email response to SM comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding Mendoza preliminary email reply to TUSD email response to SM comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email request regarding preparation of TUSD email response to SM comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Richardson request for Fisher desegregation budget RFI
6/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response regarding preparation of TUSD email response to SM comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email reply regarding 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding restoration of TUSDStats demographics webpage
6/10/2015	0.2	Drafting email to TUSD counsel regarding forthcoming TUSD response to Fisher urgent CMP RFI
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/10/2015	0.2	Drafting first email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response regarding forthcoming TUSD response to Fisher urgent CMP RFI
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown third email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/10/2015	0.5	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding CMP presentation to TUSD GB
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding preparation of TUSD email response to SM comments on TUSD TEI weighting
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher representatives’ position on AA CRCs
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email reply regarding 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/11/2015	0.4	Reviewing Brown email and attached narrative description of revisions to 2015-16 SY GSRR
6/11/2015	0.1	Drafting second email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown third email regarding stipulation to revised CMP briefing schedule
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding possible Fisher desegregation budget RFI
6/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/11/2015	2.5	Reviewing document number 1808 = TUSD notice and final, revised CMP
6/11/2015	1	Researching Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/11/2015	1	Drafting Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/11/2015	0.5	Continuing to review video footage of TUSD GB CMP presentation
6/11/2015	0.7	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza request for remedial plan to address TUSD CRC noncompliance
6/11/2015	0.2	Drafting email inquiry to Tolleson regarding reported sale of Van Horne campus without NARA or DIA
6/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached research summary
6/12/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM GSRR comments
6/12/2015	0.2	Reviewing Eichner email and attached DOJ GSRR comments
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding DOJ GSRR comments

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

6/12/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD final, revised CMP
6/12/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/12/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/12/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1809 = court order approving TUSD Dietz NARA
6/12/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza GSRR comments
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding Mendoza GSRR comments
6/12/2015	0.1	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding GSRR and CRCs
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email supplement to Mendoza GSRR comments
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding multicultural course offerings
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor and Nodine emails regarding reported sale of Van Horne campus without NARA or DIA
6/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor preliminary email response to Mendoza request for remedial plan to address TUSD CRC noncompliance
6/13/2015	0.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/13/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/13/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM CMP memorandum
6/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM invoice for May 2015
6/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding budget and plan for Tully GATE transition
6/14/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/14/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/14/2015	0.5	Reviewing video footage of TUSD GB CMP presentation
6/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD staff Elenes email regarding SM invoice for May 2015
6/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for Fisher AAAATF RFI
6/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email to Brammer regarding update on status of desegregation budget for 2015-16 SY
6/15/2015	1	Reviewing TUSD staff Hart email and attached 05/22/15 TUSD responses to Fisher AAAATF RFI
6/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding 05/22/15 TUSD responses to Fisher AAAATF RFI
6/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding update on status of desegregation budget for 2015-16 SY
6/15/2015	1	Researching TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/15/2015	1	Drafting Fisher informal RFI on TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/15/2015	1	Consulting with class representatives regarding TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/16/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/16/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/16/2015	1.5	Continuing to research TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/16/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft Fisher informal RFI on TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/16/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/16/2015	0.2	Drafting email renewal of Fisher 05/18/15 desegregation budget RFI
6/16/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brown preliminary email response to Fisher 05/18/15 desegregation budget RFI
6/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD final, revised CMP
6/17/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/17/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown third email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	0.6	Continuing to research TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/17/2015	0.4	Continuing to draft Fisher informal RFI on TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email response to TUSD GB member Hicks USP implementation cost RFI
6/17/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown fourth email regarding stipulation to waive NARA/DIA requirement for elimination of magnet status at Cragin and Ochoa
6/17/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Hawley regarding Fisher informal RFI on TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first regarding Fisher informal RFI on TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/17/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached research summary
6/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding meeting with Fisher representatives to discuss TUSD desegregation budget
6/18/2015	0.5	Reviewing Richardson email and attached Fisher representative GSRR feedback
6/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email response to Fisher 05/29/15 CMP RFI
6/18/2015	0.4	Reviewing Brown email response to Fisher 05/18/15 desegregation budget RFI
6/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding Fisher informal RFI on TUSD compliance with / implementation of CRC requirements
6/18/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding TUSD response to Fisher 05/29/15 CMP RFI
6/18/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding TUSD response to Fisher 05/18/15 desegregation budget RFI
6/18/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached Van Horne DIA

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

6/18/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding Fisher representative GSRR feedback
6/18/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Brown regarding meeting with Fisher representatives to discuss TUSD desegregation budget
6/18/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD final, revised CMP
6/18/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/18/2015	3.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/18/2015	1.8	Reviewing document number 1813 = Mendoza objection to TUSD final, revised CMP
6/18/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1814 = DOJ comments on TUSD final, revised CMP
6/18/2015	1	Drafting email reply to TUSD nonresponse to Fisher 05/29/15 CMP RFI
6/18/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD revised GSRR and responses to SM comments on GSRR
6/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email to Taylor regarding DOJ RFI regarding TUSD Van Horne DIA
6/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brammer email regarding proposed timeline for collaborative compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding proposed timeline for collaborative compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for meeting with IC member Montano
6/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding attached Fisher CRC compliance RFI
6/19/2015	2.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD proposed final USP budget for 2016 FY and cover letter
6/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email request for meeting with IC member Montano
6/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email request for meeting with TUSD Director of Desegregation Taylor
6/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/19/2015	2.4	Reviewing document number 1816 = TUSD individual magnet school improvement plans
6/19/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding requested meetings with Montano and Taylor
6/20/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD proposed final USP budget for 2016 FY and cover letter
6/20/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD individual magnet school improvement plans
6/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher request for meeting with IC member Montano
6/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email proposal regarding amendment to CMP briefing schedule
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email response to DOJ RFI regarding TUSD Van Horne DIA
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email response regarding meeting with Fisher representatives
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/22/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding meeting with Taylor
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding Fisher GSRR comments
6/22/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding Fisher feedback on desegregation budget
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding Fisher feedback on desegregation budget
6/22/2015	0.6	Reviewing Balentine email and attached line item comparison of desegregation budget drafts
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request for hard copy of 2014-15 desegregation budget
6/23/2015	0.3	Drafting email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding amendment of CMP
6/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez second email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/23/2015	0.2	Drafting email inquiry to Hawley regarding amendment of CMP
6/24/2015	0.2	Reviewing Waterkotte email and attached proposed stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding proposed stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding proposed stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/24/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding Fisher representatives’ availability to meet
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding proposed stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding proposed stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email request regarding LSC positions
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email queries for Taylor meeting
6/24/2015	0.2	Drafting second email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email response regarding Fisher representatives’ availability to meet
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky second email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fourth email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/24/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1817 = TUSD joint stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding proposed stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/25/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding Fisher position on LSC / budget / teacher shortage

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

6/25/2015	0.2	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding availability to meet Taylor
6/25/2015	0.2	Drafting email desegregation budget RFI necessary before meeting with Taylor
6/25/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article on UHS principal opening for upcoming school year
6/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher position on LSC / budget / teacher shortage
6/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding CMP briefing schedule and compliance with 06/12/15 order
6/25/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached documents summarizing CMP amendment
6/25/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding Fisher representatives’ availability to meet
6/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding availability to meet
6/25/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Balentine regarding contact information
6/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email regarding contact information
6/25/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Fisher renewed and amended CMP RFI
6/25/2015	1.8	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Mendoza request for remedial CRC implementation plan
6/26/2015	0.4	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding Fisher position on LSC / budget / teacher shortage
6/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email reply to TUSD response to DOJ RFI regarding TUSD Van Horne DIA
6/26/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley and Brown emails regarding TUSD responses to SM desegregation budget RFI
6/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/26/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1818 = order granting TUSD joint stipulated motion to modify CMP briefing schedule
6/26/2015	1.3	Reviewing document number 1819 = TUSD response to Mendoza objection to TUSD CMP
6/26/2015	1.2	Reviewing document number 1820 = TUSD response to Fisher objection to TUSD CMP
6/26/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email response to Fisher budget RFI necessary before meeting with Taylor
6/26/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor amended email response to Fisher budget RFI necessary before meeting with Taylor and attached documents
6/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding TUSD summer closure
6/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding CMP timing
6/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding CMP timing
6/29/2015	0.4	Reviewing Richardson email and attached Fisher representatives’ invoice
6/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email stipulation to TUSD Van Horne NARA
6/29/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM TE memorandum
6/29/2015	0.5	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD proposed in-school intervention (ISI) and District Alternative Education Program (DAE) programs
6/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
6/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1821 = SM Van Horne R&R
6/30/2015	1	Continuing to consult with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD proposed in-school intervention (ISI) and District Alternative Education Program (DAE) programs
6/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email and attached TUSD proposed order approving Van Horne NARA
7/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/1/2015	1.4	Reviewing document number 1822 = Mendoza objection to TUSD individual magnet school improvement plans
7/1/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1823 = TUSD notice regarding filing of proposed order regarding SM Van Horne R&R
7/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email stipulation to TUSD Van Horne NARA
7/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached summary of role of principals in teacher evaluation
7/1/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher Budget / ISI / DAEP RFI
7/1/2015	1	Researching TUSD USP budget and ISI and DAE programs
7/1/2015	1	Drafting Fisher Budget / ISI / DAEP RFI
7/2/2015	0.3	Consulting with Fisher representative regarding drop-out prevention grant and 12-month contract for AASD student success specialists
7/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/2/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order and attached 11/04/13 review process memorandum
7/2/2015	1	Continuing to research TUSD USP budget and ISI and DAE programs
7/2/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher Budget / ISI / DAEP RFI
7/2/2015	0.2	Drafting email objection to TUSD ISI and DAE programs
7/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding funding of LSC positions
7/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding disclosure of TUSD LSC evaluation
7/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Balentine email regarding funding of LSC positions
7/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM quotes on teacher evaluation in ADS
7/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding disclosure of TUSD LSC evaluation
7/6/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher 07/02/15 RFI regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/7/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding Mendoza questions regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/7/2015	1	Preparing for teleconference regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/7/2015	1	Participating in teleconference regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding call-in information for teleconference
7/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding Mendoza questions regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding teleconference
7/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/7/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1824 = TUSD response to Mendoza objection to TUSD individual magnet school improvement plans

Table 1. Statement of attorney's fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

7/7/2015	0.5	Drafting email response to Tolleson regarding teleconference
7/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email reply regarding teleconference
7/7/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/8/2015	0.3	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza memorandum response regarding CRC non-compliance
7/8/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor partial email response to Fisher 07/02/15 RFI regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/8/2015	0.5	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached Ninth Circuit ruling in Arce v. Huppenthal
7/8/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza questions regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding Mendoza questions regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.9	Reviewing Brown emails and attached final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding funding of parent conference
7/9/2015	0.7	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	3	Researching Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	1	Drafting Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD update on desegregation allocations of \$5 million in M&O funds
7/9/2015	0.3	Reviewing Richardson first email regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/9/2015	1.7	Reviewing document number 1825 = CMP R&R
7/9/2015	0.2	Drafting first email regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding funding of parent conference
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson second email regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.2	Drafting second email regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson third email regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson fourth email regarding Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/10/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached Morado memorandum response regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/10/2015	0.1	Drafting first email regarding Morado memorandum response regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/10/2015	0.1	Drafting second email regarding Morado memorandum response regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Morado memorandum response regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding 2015-16 USP budget
7/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/11/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/11/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/12/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order and attached proposal
7/12/2015	1.5	Continuing to research Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/12/2015	1.5	Continuing to draft Fisher final recommendations for 2015-16 USP budget
7/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley emails and attached SM invoice for June 2015
7/13/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM memorandum regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached data on refugees served in 2014-15 SY by country of birth and USP ethnicity
7/14/2015	0.2	Drafting email request to SM for disclosure of IC member Payton research into positive student behavior
7/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1826 = court order adopting SM Van Horne R&R
7/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher request for disclosure of IC member Payton research into positive student behavior
7/14/2015	0.5	Researching Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/14/2015	0.5	Drafting Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/15/2015	1.2	Reviewing document number 1827 = TUSD notice of TUSD GB adoption of 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/15/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM RFI regarding final budget recommendations and budget process narrative
7/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/16/2015	0.2	Drafting email inquiry regarding briefing TUSD notice of adoption of 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/16/2015	2	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached redline GSRR 14-15 SY vs. 15-16 SY

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

7/16/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/16/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding briefing TUSD notice of adoption of 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/16/2015	0.5	Reviewing TUSD GB 07/14/15 discussion of, presentation on and adoption of 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding TUSD CRC non-compliance
7/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding briefing TUSD notice of adoption of 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson second email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fourth email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD GB 07/14/15 discussion of, presentation on and adoption of 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/17/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/17/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner second email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fifth email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner second email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson third email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/17/2015	0.5	Researching TUSD AAAATF funding commitments/allocation
7/17/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD AAAATF funding commitments/allocation
7/18/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/18/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/19/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/19/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/20/2015	0.5	Reviewing Balentine email and attached memorandum regarding Foster USP allocations
7/20/2015	1.5	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza memorandum on TUSD CRC noncompliance
7/20/2015	1	Researching timeline of TUSD notice and plaintiff requests regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/20/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding timeline of TUSD notice and plaintiff requests regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/20/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/20/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/20/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1828 = TUSD objection to SM CMP R&R
7/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached student assignment reconfiguration calendar
7/20/2015	1.5	Reviewing Waterkotte email and attached TUSD GB approved PE and TE tools and models and Danielson TE instrument framework
7/21/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM HR memorandum
7/21/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on redline GSRR 14-15 SY vs. 15-16 SY
7/21/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/21/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/21/2015	1.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/21/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD responses to SM 07/15/15 USP budget RFI
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer sixth email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson fourth email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer seventh email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer eighth email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer ninth email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer tenth email regarding teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/22/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding student assignment committee and grade reconfiguration
7/22/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson fifth email regarding teleconference regarding ISI and DAE programs
7/22/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding correction to attached GSRR

Table 1. Statement of attorney's fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

7/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding IC member Payton research and ISI and DAE programs
7/22/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/22/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brammer email regarding agenda for teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding agenda for teleconference regarding compliance with 06/12/15 order
7/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding timeliness of SM 07/15/15 USP budget RFI
7/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding Mendoza comments on redline GSRR 14-15 SY vs. 15-16 SY
7/23/2015	1.5	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/23/2015	1.5	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/24/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/24/2015	3	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/24/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/24/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1829 = Mendoza objection to TUSD 2015-16 FY USP budget
7/24/2015	1.3	Reviewing Waterkotte email and attached TUSD response to Fisher CRC RFI
7/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding extension of deadline for TUSD response to Fisher CRC RFI
7/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding plaintiff stipulation to TUSD motion for leave to respond to plaintiff budget objections
7/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding plaintiff stipulation to TUSD motion for leave to respond to plaintiff budget objections
7/27/2015	2.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Fisher/SM CRC RFI
7/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding plaintiff stipulation to TUSD motion for leave to respond to plaintiff budget objections
7/28/2015	2.2	Continuing to review TUSD response to Fisher/SM CRC RFI
7/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1831 = TUSD motion for leave to respond to plaintiff budget objections
7/29/2015	1.9	Continuing to review TUSD response to Fisher/SM CRC RFI
7/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email renewal of Mendoza 07/23/15 request for ISI/DAE plans
7/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
7/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1832 = order granting TUSD motion for leave to respond to plaintiff budget objections
7/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email and attached summary of 07/24/15 process teleconference
7/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding Mendoza 07/23/15 request for ISI/DAE plans
7/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Mendoza 07/23/15 request for ISI/DAE plans
7/30/2015	1.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached ISI/DAE documents
7/30/2015	0.8	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza request for SM T&P evaluation R&R
7/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding protocol for TUSD response to RFI
7/31/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding grade reconfiguration
7/31/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding protocol for TUSD response to RFI
8/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor and Nodine emails and attached SAC calendar
8/4/2015	1	Reviewing SAC materials from DLR site
8/5/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding SAC
8/5/2015	0.4	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza comments on ISI/DAE plan documents
8/5/2015	0.5	Continuing to review SAC materials from DLR site
8/5/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding SAC
8/6/2015	0.5	Continuing to review SAC materials from DLR site
8/6/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding SAC
8/7/2015	0.5	Continuing to review SAC materials from DLR site
8/7/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding SAC
8/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding SAC
8/7/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown email and attached Townsend DIA
8/8/2015	1.5	Researching Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/8/2015	1	Drafting Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/8/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/9/2015	3.5	Continuing to research Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/9/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/9/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding Townsend DIA
8/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding Townsend DIA
8/10/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brown email and attached revised Townsend DIA
8/10/2015	2.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Mendoza request for T&P evaluation plans R&R
8/10/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Taylor regarding attached Fisher 08/10/15 preliminary objection to TUSD SAC
8/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding USP conference
8/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor second email regarding USP conference
8/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding TUSD response to Mendoza request for T&P evaluation plans R&R

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

8/11/2015	1.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM draft USP budget R&R
8/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding USP conference
8/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding USP conference
8/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding LSC evaluation
8/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding SM draft USP budget R&R and ISI/DAE plans
8/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding Townsend DIA
8/12/2015	1.3	Drafting Fisher comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding Townsend DIA
8/12/2015	0.1	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/12/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM 08/12/15 T&PE memorandum
8/12/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM July 2015 invoice
8/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email invitation regarding plaintiff participation in SAC meeting
8/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding USP conference
8/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding plaintiff participation in SAC meeting
8/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding plaintiff participation in SAC meeting
8/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding LSC evaluation
8/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding SM 08/12/15 T&PE memorandum
8/13/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding Fisher comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/13/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM 08/13/15 memorandum on Mendoza comments on T&PE
8/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding linked SAC meeting materials
8/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/13/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding USP conference
8/14/2015	1.5	Reviewing TUSD responses to SMP comments on SAC
8/14/2015	1.5	Reviewing documents uploaded to DLR Group SAC folder
8/14/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding SAC
8/14/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding dual language / ELL students
8/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Townsend DIA
8/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding Townsend DIA
8/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email request regarding attachments to 04/10/13 and 04/15/13 USP emails
8/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding Townsend DIA
8/14/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding attachments to 04/10/13 and 04/15/13 USP emails
8/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding attachments to 04/10/13 and 04/15/13 USP emails
8/14/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/14/2015	0.4	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza comments on SM draft USP budget R&R
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding DOJ position on DAE/ISI programs
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding plaintiff representative attendance of SAC meeting
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding SAC teleconference
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding SAC teleconference
8/17/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher representative attendance of SAC meeting
8/17/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD response to SMP SAC comments
8/17/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM USP budget RFI
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding Townsend NARA
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding possible meeting with Fisher class representatives
8/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding SM USP budget RFI
8/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding SAC agenda
8/18/2015	0.4	Reviewing Thompson email and attached Mendoza reply to TUSD responses to SMP SAC comments
8/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding possible meeting with SM
8/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding possible meeting with SM
8/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Langford email regarding possible meeting with SM
8/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Hawley regarding possible meeting with Fisher representatives
8/19/2015	0.4	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza response to SM T&PE R&R proposals
8/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding Townsend NARA
8/19/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brown first email response to SM USP budget RFI
8/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding TUSD response to SM USP budget RFI
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding USP conference
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding USP conference
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson second email regarding USP conference
8/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding TUSD response to SM USP budget RFI
8/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown email and attached Ruiz letter
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding Townsend NARA

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

8/20/2015	1	Consulting with class representatives regarding SAC meeting
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email response to SM USP budget RFI
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson first email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson second email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Foster first email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/21/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown third email response to SM USP budget RFI
8/22/2015	1.5	Reviewing Hawley emails and attached SM drafts of USP budget R&R
8/24/2015	1	Reviewing Richardson third email regarding AAAATF RFI and attachments thereto
8/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Peterkin first email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
8/24/2015	2	Reviewing document numbers 1833 and 1834 = SM USP budget R&R and attachments thereto
8/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding SAC teleconference
8/24/2015	0.3	Reviewing Foster email and attached LSC report
8/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding LSC report
8/24/2015	2	Reviewing Foster email and attached revised LSC report
8/24/2015	0.2	Reviewing Richardson email regarding SAC meeting
8/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
8/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1835 = TUSD Townsend NARA
8/25/2015	0.5	Drafting Fisher 08/25/15 SAC RFI
8/25/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Taylor regarding plaintiff representative participation in SAC teleconference and Fisher SAC RFI
8/25/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached SAC teleconference agenda
8/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson fourth email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/25/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email regarding Mendoza objection to SAC teleconference agenda
8/26/2015	2.5	Participating in SAC teleconference
8/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding SAC teleconference
8/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson third email regarding USP conference
8/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding USP conference
8/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding USP conference
8/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson third email regarding USP conference
8/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding SAC teleconference
8/27/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding meeting with SM
8/27/2015	0.2	Reviewing Nodine email regarding SAC teleconference and attached SAC calendar
8/27/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SAC teleconference and grade reconfiguration
8/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding meeting with Fisher representatives
8/28/2015	0.1	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding meeting with SM
8/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson fifth email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
8/28/2015	3.5	Reviewing document number 1836 = SM T&PE R&R and attachments thereto
8/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding meeting with SM
8/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson sixth email regarding AAAATF RFI
8/31/2015	2	Participating in meeting with SM and Fisher representatives
8/31/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
8/31/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1837 = TUSD motion for leave to exceed page limit of response to SM USP budget
9/1/2015	0.3	Consulting with class representatives regarding Project More facilities
9/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
9/1/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1838 and 1839 = court orders approving Townsend NARA and TUSD motion to exceed
9/1/2015	0.7	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD response to SMP USP budget objections / recommendations
9/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson seventh email regarding AAAATF RFI
9/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson eighth email regarding AAAATF RFI
9/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding SAC teleconference
9/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding SAC teleconference
9/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding DOJ counsel
9/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson ninth email regarding AAAATF RFI
9/3/2015	0.5	Drafting email and attached AAAATF RFI
9/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding AAAATF RFI
9/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Waterkotte email and attached proposed T&PE R&R stipulated motion to modify briefing schedule
9/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email response to Fisher SAC RFI
9/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
9/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1841 = TUSD notice regarding stipulation to modify T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/4/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1842 = Mendoza objection to SM T&PE R&R
9/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson tenth mail regarding AAAATF RFI

Table 1. Statement of attorney's fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

9/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding proposed T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/6/2015	0.4	Consulting with class representative regarding proposed T&PE R&R stipulated motion to modify briefing schedule
9/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Balentine invoice
9/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding IC member Payton resignation
9/8/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached Balentine invoice
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding proposed T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding proposed T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/8/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding Balentine invoice
9/8/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached Borman survey
9/8/2015	0.6	Reviewing Hawley first email and attached SM memorandum regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson eleventh email regarding AAAATF RFI
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding proposed T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached August 2015 invoice
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding IC member Payton resignation and replacement
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1843 = TUSD stipulated motion to modify T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/9/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson first email regarding AAAATF travel request
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Foster first email regarding AAAATF travel request
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fourth email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fifth email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley sixth email regarding withdrawal of magnet status and attached SM memorandum
9/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley seventh email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
9/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding IC member Payton resignation and replacement
9/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email response to TUSD T&PE R&R RFI
9/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM annual report
9/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding SM annual report
9/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding SM annual report
9/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding association of DOJ counsel Simmons
9/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding association of DOJ counsel Simmons
9/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Simmons email regarding association with TUSD case
9/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding association of DOJ counsel Simmons
9/15/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding SM annual report
9/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding SM annual report
9/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email and attached TUSD alignment response to SM T&PE R&R
9/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding possible SM course offering
9/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached proposed agenda for USP conference
9/16/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding Fisher endorsement of IC candidate Robertson
9/16/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher endorsement of IC candidate Robertson
9/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson first email regarding IC member compensation
9/16/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Richardson regarding IC member compensation
9/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson second email regarding IC member compensation
9/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher endorsement of IC candidate Robertson
9/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding amendment of SM T&PE R&R
9/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
9/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1844 = court order granting TUSD stipulated motion to modify T&PE R&R briefing schedule
9/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor first email regarding modified approach to proposed grade reconfigurations
9/18/2015	0.4	Drafting email regarding modified approach to proposed grade reconfigurations
9/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor second email regarding modified approach to proposed grade reconfigurations
9/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Richardson
9/19/2015	0.1	Drafting email response to Hawley regarding Richardson
9/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding AAAATF work

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

9/21/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson first email regarding AAAATF work
9/22/2015	0.7	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza clarifications regarding TUSD alignment response to SM T&PE R&R
9/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson second email regarding AAAATF work
9/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding amendment of SM T&PE R&R
9/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding Mendoza clarifications regarding TUSD alignment response to SM T&PE R&R
9/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding Mendoza clarifications regarding TUSD alignment response to SM T&PE R&R
9/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding USP conference agenda
9/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding USP conference agenda and attached 40th day enrollment data
9/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson first email regarding USP conference agenda
9/24/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding Fisher endorsement of IC candidate Robertson
9/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson second email regarding USP conference agenda
9/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson third email regarding USP conference agenda
9/24/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding USP conference agenda
9/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding USP conference agenda
9/25/2015	2	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
9/25/2015	0.9	Reviewing document number 1845 = SM T&PE R&R and attachments thereto
9/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD (4:74-cv-00090-DCB)
9/25/2015	0.9	Reviewing document number 1846 = TUSD motion for evidentiary hearing / status conference
9/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding private plaintiff teleconference
9/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding private plaintiff teleconference
9/25/2015	0.9	Continuing to review SM T&PE R&R
9/26/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding USP teleconference agenda
9/26/2015	1	Continuing to review SM T&PE R&R
9/28/2015	1	Reviewing TUSD motion for evidentiary hearing and attachments thereto
9/28/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representative regarding SM T&PE R&R
9/28/2015	0.3	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD motion for evidentiary hearing
9/28/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
9/28/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding private plaintiff teleconference
9/28/2015	1.5	Reviewing Brown email and attached TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
9/28/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher response in opposition to TUSD motion for hearing
9/28/2015	0.3	Continuing to review TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
9/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Campoy email regarding TUSD opposition to SM recommendation to withdraw magnet status
9/30/2015	0.3	Continuing to review TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
9/30/2015	2.5	Reviewing TUSD annual report and attachments thereto
10/1/2015	0.5	Continuing to review TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
10/1/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding TUSD annual report
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding USP conference agenda
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding USP conference agenda
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner DOJ email RFI on TUSD ISI/DAE programs
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email RFI regarding strategic goals presentation
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding SM strategic goals presentation RFI
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding documents for USP conference
10/1/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached documents for USP conference
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding USP conference agenda
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding documents for USP conference
10/1/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD annual report
10/1/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD annual report and attachments thereto
10/2/2015	0.2	Continuing to review TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD parent Schippers email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
10/2/2015	0.1	Consulting with class representative regarding Schippers email and TUSD disinformation
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD parent Schippers email regarding withdrawal of magnet status
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding DOJ grade reconfiguration RIF
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding DOJ grade reconfiguration RIF
10/2/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding USP conference agenda
10/2/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached proposed USP review process
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding USP conference agenda
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding DOJ counsel Savitsky participation in USP conference
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding USP conference agenda
10/2/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding USP conference agenda
10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding USP conference agenda
10/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley fourth email and attached amended USP conference agenda

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

10/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
10/2/2015	1.1	Reviewing document number 1853 = TUSD objection to SM T&PE R&R
10/2/2015	3	Continuing to review TUSD annual report and attachments thereto
10/3/2015	0.2	Continuing to review TUSD grade configuration proposals and DIAs
10/3/2015	0.3	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on TUSD grade reconfiguration
10/3/2015	8.5	Participating in USP conference
10/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing TUSD instructor Billeci email regarding withdrawal of magnet status at Safford K-8
10/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached presentation
10/5/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached documents
10/5/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor email and attached 40th day enrollment data
10/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding 40th day enrollement data
10/5/2015	0.2	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached revised 40th day enrollment data
10/5/2015	3.5	Participating in USP conference
10/6/2015	2.5	Meeting with SM regarding magnet stipulation
10/7/2015	2.5	Meeting with class representatives regarding magnet stipulation
10/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email and attached AA teacher document
10/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding AA teacher document
10/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding appointment of IC member Robertson
10/7/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brown email response to Fisher SAC RFI and attached Borman survey
10/7/2015	0.2	Drafting email to class representatives regarding TUSD superintendent Sanchez
10/7/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding USP presentation
10/7/2015	1.5	Continuing to review TUSD annual report and attachments thereto
10/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding magnet funding
10/8/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached magnet funding proposal
10/8/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding possible press release and meeting
10/8/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD annual report and attachments thereto
10/8/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached IC member Robertson documents
10/8/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached Maiden response to USP conference RFI
10/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
10/9/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1854 = Mendoza response in opposition to TUSD motion for hearing / conference
10/9/2015	0.5	Drafting Fisher joinder with Mendoza response in opposition to TUSD motion for hearing / conference
10/9/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1855 = Mendoza motion to strike TUSD objection to SM T&PE R&R
10/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding grade reconfiguration proposals
10/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding IC appointment
10/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding 10/09/15 filings
10/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding possible joint press conference
10/12/2015	0.1	Drafting email response to Hawley regarding 10/09/15 filings
10/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding 10/09/15 filings
10/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding grade reconfiguration proposals
10/12/2015	0.3	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached magnet school funding document
10/12/2015	0.3	Consulting with class representatives regarding magnet school proposal
10/12/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding grade reconfiguration proposals
10/12/2015	0.3	Consulting with class representatives regarding magnet school proposal
10/13/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding grade reconfiguration proposals
10/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding IC member Robertson
10/13/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email regarding magnet school rescue plan
10/15/2015	0.9	Reviewing Brammer email and attached proposed magnet school stipulation and order
10/16/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding magnet school proposal
10/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on grade reconfiguration
10/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached memorandum on teacher shortage
10/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on magnet school proposal
10/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding budget expert invoice
10/17/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM invoice for September 2015
10/18/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and linked ADS article on proposed grade reconfigurations
10/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email response to Fisher magnet school RFI
10/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding conflicting expert testimony regarding T&PE
10/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding conflicting expert testimony regarding T&PE
10/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
10/19/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1857 = TUSD reply to Mendoza response in opposition to TUSD motion for hearing
10/19/2015	0.5	Participating in teleconference with TUSD counsel Brown regarding reconfiguration and magnet stipulation
10/19/2015	0.8	Participating in teleconference with Mendoza counsel Rodriguez regarding reconfiguration and magnet stipulation

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

10/19/2015	1.5	Consulting with Fisher representatives regarding reconfiguration and magnet stipulation
10/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Brown regarding grade reconfiguration
10/19/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Brown regarding magnet stipulation
10/19/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM comments on grade reconfiguration
10/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding magnet stipulation
10/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding grade reconfiguration
10/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding magnet stipulation
10/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached IC nominee Robertson vita
10/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
10/23/2015	1.2	Reviewing document number 1858 = TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/23/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Hawley regarding SM position on TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/23/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding teleconference with SM regarding TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/23/2015	1	Reviewing video footage of 09/29/15 TUSD GB meeting regarding withdrawal of magnet status
10/23/2015	0.5	Reviewing Schelble emails and linked ADS articles on loss of magnet school funding
10/23/2015	0.7	Reviewing document number 1860 = TUSD response in opposition to Mendoza motion to strike
10/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM position on TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown first email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/27/2015	1.3	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM draft USP CMP report to court and proposed order
10/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding SM draft USP CMP R&R to court and proposed order
10/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding SM draft USP CMP report to court and proposed order
10/27/2015	1	Researched Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/27/2015	1	Drafting Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte first email regarding time to respond to SM USP CMP R&R
10/27/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding time to respond to SM USP CMP R&R
10/27/2015	0.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached 40th day enrollment data
10/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding time to respond to SM USP CMP R&R
10/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown second email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/28/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/28/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/28/2015	1	Continuing to review video footage of 09/29/15 TUSD GB meeting regarding withdrawal of magnet status
10/28/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/28/2015	0.2	Drafting first email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte second email regarding time to respond to SM USP CMP R&R
10/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding time to respond to SM USP CMP R&R
10/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown third email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.2	Drafting second email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown fourth email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown fifth email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner second email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.4	Participating in teleconference with TUSD counsel Brown regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.3	Participating in teleconference with Mendoza counsel Rodriguez regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.3	Participating in teleconference with Mendoza counsel Thompson regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner third email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/30/2015	0.2	Drafting third email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/30/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/30/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/30/2015	0.5	Continuing to review video footage of 09/29/15 TUSD GB meeting regarding withdrawal of magnet status
10/30/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD-Mendoza magnet school stipulation
10/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez second email regarding stipulation to TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
10/30/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding time to respond to SM USP CMP R&R
10/30/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
10/30/2015	0.7	Reviewing document number 1861 = Mendoza reply to TUSD response to Mendoza motion to strike
10/30/2015	0.5	Continuing to review TUSD annual report
11/2/2015	0.5	Drafting Fisher comments on TUSD annual report

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

11/2/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brammer email and attached revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/2/2015	0.5	Meeting with class representative regarding TUSD hiring practices at Utterback Magnet MS
11/2/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached quarterly desegregation budget report
11/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/3/2015	0.5	Continuing to review TUSD annual report
11/3/2015	0.5	Drafting Fisher comments on TUSD annual report
11/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fourth email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fifth email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding revised SM CMP R&R and proposed order
11/3/2015	0.5	Continuing to review TUSD annual report
11/4/2015	0.5	Drafting Fisher comments on TUSD annual report
11/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
11/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1863 = SM motion to appoint IC member Robertson
11/4/2015	0.5	Reviewing Waterkotte email and attached proposed revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding proposed revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding proposed revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/4/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding reported disproportionate discipline of AA students at Palo Verde HS and Roskrige MS
11/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding reported disproportionate discipline of AA students at Palo Verde HS and Roskrige MS
11/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding proposed revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/4/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley fourth email regarding proposed revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Balentine email and attached review of first quarter desegregation budget report
11/5/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brammer email and attached revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley fifth email regarding proposed revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/5/2015	0.2	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached revised TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation and proposed order
11/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
11/5/2015	0.4	Reviewing document number 1864 = SM magnet R&R
11/5/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding possible Fisher opposition to SM magnet R&R
11/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding magnet rally
11/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
11/6/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1865 = TUSD-Mendoza second magnet stipulation
11/6/2015	0.6	Reviewing Richardson email and attached TUSD GB member Hicks correspondence to Court and linked video and article
11/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing class representative first email regarding TUSD-initiated magnet petitions
11/6/2015	0.2	Reviewing class representative second email regarding TUSD-initiated magnet petitions
11/7/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Ochoa petition
11/7/2015	2.5	Continuing to research Fisher response to second TUSD-Mendoza magnet stipulation
11/8/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher opposition to magnet R&R
11/9/2015	1	Outlining Fisher objections to magnet R&R
11/9/2015	0.3	Reviewing Molina affidavit
11/9/2015	0.7	Researching Fisher opposition to SM magnet R&R
11/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Schelble email summary of SM interview regarding early September meetings
11/9/2015	0.4	Consulting with Schelble regarding interview with SM regarding early September meetings
11/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing TW article on "grassroots" opposition to withdrawal of magnet status
11/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of filing of document number 1863 = text entry order granting motion to appoint Robertson to IC
11/9/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached detailed description of IC member Robertson duties
11/9/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding UHS admissions process
11/9/2015	0.5	Reviewing Three Sonorans blog entries regarding TUSD magnets
11/10/2015	1	Consulting with class representative regarding outline of Fisher objections to SM magnet R&R
11/10/2015	0.5	Reviewing party magnet correspondence between 09/30/15 and 11/10/15
11/10/2015	1	Researching TUSD magnet petition campaign
11/10/2015	1	Continuing to research Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email confirmation of Schelble interview regarding early September meetings
11/10/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brammer first email and attached draft NARA, proposed order and proposed motion regarding grade reconfiguration
11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email correction
11/10/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brammer second email and attached draft NARA, proposed order and proposed motion regarding grade reconfiguration
11/10/2015	0.3	Reviewing attachments to Hicks' letter (Safford K-8 form letters, El Casino invite etc.)
11/10/2015	0.2	Reviewing video footage of David Morales rebutting Brian Flagg and Cesar Aguirre at TUSD GB 10/06/15 meeting
11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding video footage of David Morales rebutting Brian Flagg and Cesar Aguirre at TUSD GB 10/06/15 meeting

Table 1. Statement of attorney's fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing letter sent to Safford K-8 parents signed by Safford Principal Steven Gabaldon
11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing misinformation and appeal appearing on Safford K-8 webpage
11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing letter to parents from Cholla Principal Frank Armenta claiming loss of \$1.1 million
11/10/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/10/2015	3	Continuing to research Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/11/2015	2.5	Drafting Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding plaintiff stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding plaintiff stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/11/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding plaintiff stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/11/2015	0.2	Reviewing video footage of Cesar Aguirre speaking at El Casino 11/10/15 regarding magnet status withdrawal
11/11/2015	4	Continuing to research Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/12/2015	3.5	Continuing to draft Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding plaintiff stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/12/2015	0.1	Drafting email stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fourth email regarding plaintiff stipulation to grade reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
11/12/2015	0.5	Reviewing Tolleson email and attached and linked TUSD annual report appendices
11/12/2015	0.5	Reviewing video footage of 09/08/15 GB meeting and GB member Stegeman objection to Sanchez comments on withdrawal of magnet status
11/12/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson and Hawley emails regarding TUSD annual report appendices
11/12/2015	0.4	Reviewing Brown email and attached grade reconfiguration NARA documents
11/12/2015	2	Continuing to research Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/13/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher opposition to SM R&R
11/13/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached document regarding teacher cut scores
11/13/2015	0.5	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza RIF regarding TUSD annual report
11/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding UHS admissions process
11/13/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding UHS admissions process
11/13/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article on TUSD contract to rewrite GSRR
11/15/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding reported TUSD contract to rewrite GSRR
11/15/2015	0.5	Reviewing TUSD grade reconfiguration documents
11/15/2015	0.6	Researching TUSD grade reconfiguration proposals
11/15/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article on TUSD grade reconfigurations
11/15/2015	0.6	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration documents
11/16/2015	0.5	Continuing to research TUSD grade reconfiguration proposals
11/16/2015	0.3	Reviewing document number 1868 = TUSD joint motion regarding grade reconfiguration NARA
11/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notifications of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
11/16/2015	0.5	Reviewing document number 1869 = TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA
11/16/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached draft of SM annual report (SAR)
11/16/2015	1	Continuing to review draft SAR
11/17/2015	0.5	Reviewing challenged exhibits attached to Fisher response
11/17/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding TUSD request to file response to Fisher response
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Waterkotte email regarding TUSD request to file response to Fisher response
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Campoy email regarding Sanchez note regarding magnet school meeting
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding TUSD request to file response to Fisher response
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding UHS admissions process
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding UHS admissions process
11/17/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding communication with media
11/17/2015	0.3	Drafting email regarding Fisher opposition to TUSD request to file response to Fisher response
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding TUSD request to file response to Fisher response
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Fisher representatives meeting with Holladay MS principal
11/18/2015	0.5	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence and attached emails and board item
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email stipulation to SAR review and comment schedule
11/18/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Fisher representative comments on TUSD annual report (AR) and SAR
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding party stipulation to SAR review and comment schedule
11/18/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article by TUSD GB member Grijalva regarding magnets
11/18/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding party stipulation to SAR review and comment schedule
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher representatives meeting with Holladay MS principal
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding party stipulation to SAR review and comment schedule
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Fisher representatives meeting regarding Fisher comments on TUSD AR and SAR
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley third email regarding party stipulation to SAR review and comment schedule
11/18/2015	0.4	Reviewing Hawley email and attached amended SAR

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email stipulation to SAR review and comment schedule
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky first email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/18/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez second email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/18/2015	0.3	Reviewing Schelble emails and linked ADS article by Cesar Aguirre regarding magnets
11/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
11/19/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1870 = court order adopting SM magnet R&R
11/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding confidentiality of party email correspondence
11/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fourth email regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/19/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/19/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding court order adopting SM magnet R&R
11/19/2015	1	Continuing to review amended draft SAR
11/19/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
11/19/2015	0.3	Continuing to review Mendoza RFI regarding TUSD AR
11/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble second email rebuttal of ADS opinion editorial by Cesar Aguirre regarding TUSD magnets
11/19/2015	0.3	Reviewing Campoy email and linked full video footage of TUSD magnet rally at El Casino Ballroom
11/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email at TUSD GB president Grijalva regarding attached court order
11/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley emails and attached SM invoice and cover sheet for October 2015
11/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
11/20/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1871 = TUSD notice of intent to file report regarding Hicks allegations
11/20/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD annual report
11/20/2015	1	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD annual report
11/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Fisher representatives meeting regarding Fisher comments on TUSD AR and SAR
11/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding omission of discipline section from amended draft of SAR
11/20/2015	0.5	Reviewing Hawley email and attached complete amended draft SAR
11/20/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding complete amended draft SAR
11/20/2015	2	Continuing to review TUSD AR
11/21/2015	1	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD AR
11/21/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD AR
11/22/2015	0.9	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD AR
11/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding complete amended draft SAR
11/22/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding grade reconfiguration parent surveys
11/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding grade reconfiguration NARA assurances
11/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/23/2015	0.5	Reviewing Campoy 11/19/15 desegregation update
11/23/2015	1.5	Continuing to review TUSD AR
11/23/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD AR
11/23/2015	0.5	Reviewing Superintendent’s Strategic Plan for the 2015--16 SY
11/23/2015	0.6	Cross-checking TUSD AR commitments against USP requirements
11/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/23/2015	2	Meeting with Fisher representatives regarding TUSD AR
11/24/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD AR
11/24/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD AR
11/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/24/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brown email regarding grade reconfiguration NARA assurances and attached Nodine declaration
11/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson email regarding confidentiality of party correspondence
11/24/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding deadline for plaintiff feedback on / objection to TUSD AR
11/24/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez email regarding deadline for plaintiff feedback on / objection to TUSD AR
11/24/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding complete amended draft SAR
11/24/2015	1	Consulting with Fisher representative regarding TUSD AR, SM AR and TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA
11/25/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD AR
11/25/2015	1	Reviewing appendices to TUSD AR
11/25/2015	0.5	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD AR
11/25/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding grade reconfiguration NARA assurances
11/25/2015	0.4	Reviewing Schelble email and linked Safier Tucson Weekly blog entry on degree of segregation in TUSD versus charter sector
11/25/2015	1.5	Continuing to review TUSD AR
11/27/2015	1.5	Continuing to review appendices to TUSD AR
11/27/2015	1	Continuing to draft comments on TUSD AR
11/27/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

11/27/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
11/28/2015	1.5	Reviewing past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
11/28/2015	0.5	Reviewing Court order regarding grade reconfiguration
11/28/2015	0.2	Drafting email to class representatives regarding comments on AAAATF and SM AR
11/29/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
11/29/2015	1.3	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
11/29/2015	1	Reviewing past email correspondence regarding reconfiguration NARA
11/29/2015	1.5	Consulting with class member regarding reconfiguration NARA
11/29/2015	0.3	Consulting with Mendoza counsel Thompson regarding deadline for plaintiff responses to TUSD reconfiguration NARA
11/29/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked KVOA article on TUSD expectation of lower achievement scores on new test
11/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding AzMERIT results
11/29/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
11/30/2015	1.5	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
11/30/2015	0.5	Consulting with class member regarding reconfiguration NARA
11/30/2015	1	Drafting Fisher response in opposition to TUSD NARA
11/30/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher comments on SM AR
12/1/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD AR
12/1/2015	0.3	Consulting with class representatives regarding SM and TUSD AR
12/1/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Fisher representatives regarding SM and TUSD AR
12/1/2015	0.5	Reviewing Richardson email and attached AAAATF and SM AR comments
12/1/2015	1	Incorporating Richardson comments into Fisher comments on SM AR
12/1/2015	0.3	Researching Reynolds DIA
12/1/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding Reynolds DIA
12/1/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher comments on SM AR
12/2/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD AR
12/2/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representatives regarding SM and TUSD AR
12/2/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding disclosure of TUSD AzMERIT test results
12/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding Reynolds DIA
12/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked Weekly blogger Safier entry on AzMERIT scores
12/2/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article on AzMERIT scores
12/2/2015	0.3	Reviewing Hawley emails and attached SM USP 2014-15 status report
12/2/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding SM USP 2014-15 status report
12/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding SM USP 2014-15 status report
12/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding disclosure of TUSD AzMERIT test results
12/3/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding disclosure of TUSD AzMERIT test results
12/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding SM USP 2014-15 status report
12/3/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
12/3/2015	1	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
12/3/2015	2	Continuing to draft Fisher response in opposition to TUSD NARA
12/3/2015	0.2	Reviewing Stegeman email and attached letter to Bury
12/3/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
12/3/2015	0.7	Reviewing document number 1872 = TUSD motion for reconsideration of magnet order
12/3/2015	0.2	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
12/4/2015	0.3	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
12/4/2015	1.7	Continuing to draft Fisher response in opposition to TUSD NARA
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding Reynolds DIA
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding Reynolds DIA
12/4/2015	0.2	Drafting email to Hawley regarding Fisher Plaintiffs’ 12/04/15 comments on 11/20/15 draft of SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding mid-year 2015 TUSD report
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing document number 1874 = court order granting TUSD reconfiguration NARA briefing schedule
12/4/2015	1	Reviewing Rodriguez email and attached Mendoza comments on SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	0.2	Reviewing Taylor first email and attached TUSD comments on SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	0.1	Drafting first email to Taylor regarding TUSD comments on SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor second email and attached TUSD comments on SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding SM AR
12/4/2015	0.1	Drafting second email to Taylor regarding TUSD comments on SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding Fisher 12/04/15 comments on 11/20/15 draft of SM 2015 AR
12/4/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
12/5/2015	1	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
12/5/2015	1	Continuing to draft Fisher response in opposition to TUSD NARA

Table 1. Statement of attorney’s fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

12/5/2015	1.5	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
12/6/2015	1.5	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
12/6/2015	5.5	Continuing to draft Fisher response in opposition to TUSD NARA
12/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding SM visit
12/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding Deputy Superintendent position vacancy
12/6/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding access to TUSD statistics webpage
12/6/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brown email regarding access to TUSD statistics webpage
12/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding SM AR
12/7/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Mendoza RFI
12/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
12/7/2015	1	Reviewing document number 1876 = Mendoza objection to TUSD reconfiguration NARA
12/7/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding Fisher objection to TUSD reconfiguration NARA
12/7/2015	1	Continuing to review TUSD grade reconfiguration NARA and attachments thereto
12/7/2015	1.5	Continuing to review past Fisher, Mendoza and TUSD filings regarding grade reconfiguration
12/7/2015	3	Continuing to draft Fisher response in opposition to TUSD NARA
12/7/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
12/11/2015	0.4	Reviewing document number 1878 = court order denying TUSD motion for reconsideration of CMP order
12/11/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached TUSD response to Mendoza 2014-15 annual report RFI
12/11/2015	0.5	Consulting with class representative regarding order denying TUSD motion for reconsideration
12/11/2015	2.3	Reviewing Taylor email and attached disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/14/2015	0.2	Consulting with class representatives regarding disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/14/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson email regarding redaction of disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/14/2015	0.1	Reviewing Taylor email regarding redaction of disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/14/2015	0.4	Reviewing Taylor email and attached College Board AP and honors documents
12/15/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor email and attached redacted disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/15/2015	0.4	Consulting with class representatives regarding redacted disaggregated TUSD AzMERIT results
12/15/2015	0.5	Reviewing Taylor email and attached SM summary of meeting with magnet principals
12/15/2015	0.1	Reviewing Savitsky email regarding reassignment
12/15/2015	0.3	Reviewing Eichner email and linked ADS article on Secrist discipline problems
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding Secrist discipline problems
12/16/2015	1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding Secrist discipline problems and attachments thereto
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner email regarding Secrist discipline problems
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding Secrist discipline problems
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson third email regarding Secrist discipline problems
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley second email regarding Secrist discipline problems
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley email regarding meeting with magnet principals
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson first email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson first email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson second email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson third email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson fourth email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	1.3	Consulting with class representatives regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.2	Drafting email regarding pipelines
12/16/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached Balentine invoice
12/17/2015	1	Consulting with class representatives regarding pipelines
12/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Richardson email regarding possible Fisher memoranda to TUSD
12/17/2015	0.5	Reviewing Schelble email and linked blog entry on TUSD Superintendent's hostility to desegregation process
12/17/2015	0.5	Reviewing Schelble email and linked second Hicks letter to Bury regarding retention of outside counsel to investigate Hicks allegations
12/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Thompson second email regarding pipelines
12/17/2015	0.1	Reviewing Tolleson fifth email regarding pipelines
12/17/2015	1	Reviewing Taylor emails and attached TUSD response to Mendoza 2014-15 annual report RFI
12/17/2015	0.3	Reviewing Brammer email and attached TUSD HR memorandum regarding magnet vacancies
12/18/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article regarding Secrist discipline problems
12/19/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article regarding Dodge-Cholla pipeline
12/19/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
12/22/2015	0.8	Reviewing document number 1879 = court order adopting 2015-16 USP budget as recommended by SM
12/22/2015	0.3	Consulting with class representative regarding adoption of 2015-16 USP budget
12/22/2015	0.2	Reviewing Hawley email and attached SM invoice for November 2015
12/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD

Table 1. Statement of attorney's fees claimed by Rubin Salter in 4:74-cv-00090-DCB from 01/01/15 to 12/31/15

12/23/2015	1.4	Reviewing document number 1880 = TUSD response to plaintiff objections to TUSD reconfiguration NARA
12/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Schelble email and linked ADS article on desegregation litigation
12/23/2015	0.2	Reviewing Thompson email RFI regarding TUSD response to SM AR
12/23/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer email regarding TUSD response to Mendoza RFI regarding TUSD response to SM AR
12/28/2015	0.2	Reviewing Brammer first email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Rodriguez first email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer second email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/28/2015	0.1	Reviewing Hawley first email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer third email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/29/2015	0.1	Drafting email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fourth email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Eichner first email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing Brammer fifth email regarding TUSD proposed motion and order
12/29/2015	0.1	Reviewing email notification of docket activity in Fisher v TUSD
12/29/2015	0.2	Reviewing document number 1881 = TUSD motion for extension of time to seek reconsideration / clarification of budget order
12/29/2015	1	Reviewing Brammer email and linked magnet documents
12/29/2015	1	Reviewing Nodine affidavit regarding AA enrollment
12/29/2015	0.5	Researching AA enrollment in TUSD annual report
12/30/2015	0.3	Reviewing Richardson email regarding AAAATF
12/30/2015	0.2	Reviewing Richardson email regarding class representatives
12/30/2015	1	Consulting with class representatives regarding AAAATF
	819.6	Total hours at \$350 = \$286,860